4/20/22, 11:33 AM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B
D.O.A. 29/10/2021 LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Wed 20/4/2022 11:32 AM
To: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with your client's authorisation to act to us (LKK) for our
necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 April 2022 10:48 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0O.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We confirm accepted the offer at global sum of $$6,900.00, pls forward DV four our settlement.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 6 April 2022 12:23 PM

To: Enquiry

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WwE2MfQpF...  1/15


mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com

4/20/22, 11:33 AM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to your below email.

We have reviewed the matter and for an amicable settlement, we are prepared to revise our offer at a global
sum of $6,900.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 April 2022 10:06 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/AIG21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Pls see attached Rental Agreement.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 4 April 2022 5:15 PM
To: Enquiry
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Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice
Dear Ms Wong,
Kindly let us have a copy of rental agreement for Evervit Leasing PL.

EVERVIT LEASING PTE LTD

33 Tarmery Lane #1102 Singapone 347759 Tel: 6788 1313

Inwaioe Mos A4248

Date 29/10y2021

Flasng Lim Xuan Cling Wictar

Address 23 lalan Raja Udang
#1809

Singapare 329216
YWehicke Moz SL5 1351 G

DESCRIPTICON AMOLNT

450,00

i

gental From 29,10.2021 1o 01,11.2021 @55150.00 « 3 days

Total E 45000

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)
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From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 March 2022 4:59 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for your swift response, however our Insured had declined the revise offer. Pls refer to our LOD

which submitted date 7t" Jan 22, the detailed dates for the rental as below for your kind reference :-

1)Vehicle no : SLS2351G rental periods from 29/10/21 to 01/11/21 =SS 450.00
2)Vehicle no : SMT696H rental periods from 01/11/21 to 11/11/21 = S51,540.00

You have proposed a global settlement of $$6,700.00, but it was unable to defray the expenses in rentals.

We would appreciate if you could revise in an acceptable amount as proposed in our early email, so that case
can be settled amicably.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 14 March 2022 10:20 AM

To: Enquiry

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,700.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
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Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Saturday, 12 March 2022 2:36 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Our Insured requested to have at least $$7,000.00 (all-in) for settlement, pls consider.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 February 2022 12:59 PM

To: Enquiry

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.O.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our email offer dated 28/01/2022.

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WwE2MfQpF...  5/15
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Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 8:50 AM

To: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,400.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)
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From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 1:44 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/AIG21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Pls see attached.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 26 January 2022 8:54 AM

To: Enquiry

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

Please be informed that DOA was on 29 Oct 2021.

Kindly assist to amend DOA in you LOD and repair invoice.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 January 2022 1:55 PM

To: 'Enquiry' <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We are preparing report to seek mandate from insurer.

We will expedite and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Saturday, 22 January 2022 2:02 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
Any offer?
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong
S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6wE2MfQpF...  8/15
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160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Enquiry [mailto:enquiry@sh-motor.com]

Sent: Friday, 7 January 2022 11:14 AM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)'

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Pls see attached documents pertaining to TP claim.
Looking forward to receiving your favourable offer soon.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 November 2021 3:00 PM

To: Enquiry

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0O.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear /
under BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above
mentioned case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair
to your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to
the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be
based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6WwE2MfQpF...  9/15
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Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 November 2021 11:12 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0O.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
We would like to attach some accident scene photos to substantiate our stands :-

1)Image 13.39.20 (2) — you may see clearly the wording ‘AHEAD’ & yellow arrow sign on the road

2)Image 13.39.20 (6) — the display signage permitted vehicles to drive ‘OUT’ of the car park area, whereby our
Insured is following the traffic flow. Unfortunately your Insured’s lorry just reversed out from the car park lot
& hit onto his car’s left side portion which damage was severed.

Based on the above evidence we do not agree with your Insured’s statement, we sincerely hope you could re-
investigate & revert with favourable findings.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02

Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 November 2021 10:02 AM

To: Enquiry

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0O.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your email.

Kindly refer to our insured accident report for your reference.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGUOZDViNzgxLWESMTItNDkxMi1hZWIXLTA3MjhIMTAON2RiINgBGAAAAAADI7f6wE2MfQp...  10/15


mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:enquiry@sh-motor.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com

4/20/22, 11:33 AM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

We are engaging our insured on this matter.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 November 2021 9:44 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,
TP’s driver had filed accident report yesterday, you may call Ms Kin Lian HP 92340195 to confirm.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 2 November 2021 10:44 AM

To: Enquiry

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.O.A. 29/10/2021
LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice
Hi,

Please be informed that our insured has yet lodged the accident report.
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We are following up with our insured on this matter.
You may advise your client to claim OD if urgent.
Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on

the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 November 2021 10:29 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving our vehicle no : EK666L claiming TP vehicle no : GR1228B D.0O.A. 29/10/2021 LKK
REF : CC4/AIG21011095/ps3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

Pls be informed that our Insured’s car is in our workshop since 29th Oct, he had rented similar capacity vehicle
for daily transport use.

We would appreciate it if you could revert the status of liability at your soonest.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) [mailto:suli@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 29 October 2021 5:17 PM

To: 'Enquiry’; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Survey Vehicle EK 666L LKK REF : CC4/A1G21011095/ps3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,
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Please be informed that we are currently pending for our principal to release Ol GIA report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Hsiao Tong via
email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, October 29, 2021 4:42 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Survey Vehicle EK 666L

Hi,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 October, 2021 4:40 PM

To: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Survey Vehicle EK 666L

Dear Summer,
Noted with thanks & attached video footage for your kind consideration.
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity
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Singapore 575722
Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Summer (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 29 October 2021 4:26 PM

To: 'Enquiry’

Cc: 'assignments'

Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle EK 666L

Dear Ms Wong,
May we arrange survey on Monday.

Liability I will forward to admin a to follow up.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Enquiry <enquiry@sh-motor.com>

Sent: Friday, 29 October, 2021 4:18 PM

To: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Survey Vehicle EK 666L

Dear Summer,
Vehicle is IN our workshop, pls let us know who is the Officer-in-charge?
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Summer (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 29 October 2021 4:11 PM

To: 'Enquiry’

Cc: 'assignments'

Subject: Survey Vehicle EK 666L

Dear Ms Wong,

Is the vehicle EK 666L in the workshop?

Best Regards,
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Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
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