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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 12 May 2022 11:50 AM
To: huphoecoach2@hotmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 3373J(CHINA TAIPING) AND SHC 7506B AT/ALONG 

BEDOK NORTH STREET 2 ON 28/10/2021

12 May 2022 
                                                                
HUP HOE COACH SERVICE                                            [By Email Only] 
Driver: LIM CHEW GUEK (LIN QIUYUE) 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: PA3373J 
Our Ref: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 3373J(CHINA TAIPING) AND SHC 7506B AT/ALONG BEDOK NORTH STREET 2 ON 
28/10/2021 
 
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy. 
 
We have received a claim from SHC7506B against your motor insurance policy. 
 
Based on both parties report and all the available information on hand, we are of the view that liability is not in your 
driver’s favour. Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best 
to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF:
CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-SHC7506B, TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Tue 15/11/2022 9:18 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>;Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

[Confidential]

Hi Hsiao Tong
 
We agree with your proposal except for Loss of income as we have already paid for the driver’s loss of income in their
injury claim. Please advise why Citycab is claiming this head of claims again.
 

  Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 32,100.00 ($30,000.00 + 7%GST)
2. Loss of Rental (15days x $126.47) $   1,897.05 (15days x $126.47)
3. Loss of Income (15days x $80.00) $      750.00  (15days x $50.00)   - subject to proof that this is valid claim.
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          7.45
5. Towing Fee $        80.00

Total $34,084.50 or $34,834.50 if there is proof for Loss of incoicme
 
 
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Thanks and Best Regards
 
Chee So Chow
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
Main: (65) 6389 6116  I  F: (65) 6222 5879
Email : claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com  I FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   I WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Wednesday, October 12, 2022 3:56 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-
SHC7506B, TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT
 

[Confidential]
 

 

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
http://www.sg.cntaiping.com/
http://www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/
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[Confidential]
 
3rd REMINDER
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 28/07/2022.
 
Kindly let us have your instruction as third party is chasing for settlement.
 
Thank you.
 
 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Friday, 7 October 2022 8:55 AM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-
SHC7506B, TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT
 
2nd REMINDER
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 28/07/2022.
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Monday, 29 August 2022 4:06 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [SEEK MANDATE] - OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-
SHC7506B, TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to our mandate request dated 28/07/2022.
 

 
 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Thursday, 28 July 2022 8:35 AM

To: Tan Kian Wei Billy <billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [SEEK MANDATE] - OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-
SHC7506B, TPP DIRECT SETTLEMENT
 
Your ref: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW
LKK ref : CC6/CTI21011047/Dps3q2
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA3373J(CHINA TAIPING) AND SHC7506B(TP) ON 28/10/2021
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
The accident occurred when our insured driver turned out from minor road and collided with third party taxi . We are of
the view that liability is not in our driver’s favour. In addition, the police investigation result shows that action has been
initiated against our driver for the offence of careless driving.
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer “BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD" at $34,834.50(all-in).
 
The summary is as follows: -
 

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 88,884.16 $ 32,100.00 ($30,000.00 + 7%GST)
2. Loss of Rental (15days x $126.47) $   1,897.05 $   1,897.05 (15days x $126.47)
3. Loss of Income (15days x $80.00) $   1,200.00 $      750.00  (15days x $50.00)
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee $           7.45 $          7.45
5. Towing Fee $        80.00 $        80.00

Total $ 92,068.66 $ 34,834.50
 
Surveyor recommended 15days for repair.

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
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Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 27/07/2022 is only for mandate purpose.
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction.
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Tuesday, 31 May 2022 3:41 PM

To: Tan Kian Wei Billy <billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-SHC7506B, TPP
DIRECT SETTLEMENT
 
Dear Sirs/ Mdm,
 
Enclosed for your perusal is: -
 

Estimated cost of repair.
Preliminary advice.
Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition.

 
Thank you.
 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Tan Kian Wei Billy <billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com> 

Sent: Monday, 1 November, 2021 10:41 AM

To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-SHC7506B, TPP
DIRECT SETTLEMENT
 

[Confidential]
 
Hi Su Li,
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:suli@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
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Attached is OI GIA report.


Thanks
 
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as
delay is to be expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via
email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Thanks and Best Regards
 
Billy Tan
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896175   |   F: (65) 62247175  
  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

 
 
From: Claims Dept of CTI 

Sent: Friday, 29 October 2021 1:57 PM

To: Tan Kian Wei Billy <billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com>; suli@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM21D206176/C02/PA3373J/TANKW AND YOUR REF: CC6/CTI21011047/ps3-SHC7506B, TPP DIRECT
SETTLEMENT
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
     via EMAIL ONLY
 
Dear Billy,
 
Please refer to the appended email.
 
Please revert to LKK Auto on Direct Settlement SHC7506B  soonest possible.
 
Please contact our claims department Billy Tan  6389 6175 the officer in charge.
 
*Kindly quote our claim reference number when replying.*
 
NOTICE :
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be
expected for handling hardcopy documents.  All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
or fax at 6224 7175.  . Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
 
Thank you
 
Angie Foo
Claims Department
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 63896116   |   F: (65) 62247175  

mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fcheckpoint.url-protection.com%2Fv1%2Furl%3Fo%3Dhttps%253A%2F%2Fapc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%253Furl%253Dhttp%25253A%25252F%25252Fwww.sg.cntaiping.com%25252F%2526amp%253Bdata%253D04%25257C01%25257Cbilly.tan%252540sg.cntaiping.com%25257C0309f205d55741ffe05e08d8edcfaeac%25257C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%25257C0%25257C0%25257C637520823662351260%25257CUnknown%25257CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%25253D%25257C1000%2526amp%253Bsdata%253D4O4ALywigFzv9LIOs6F2Bk3wOJ%25252Fe0dAmD44lwtDahQg%25253D%2526amp%253Breserved%253D0%26g%3DNWVmZThiN2FiYzI2MjFiOQ%3D%3D%26h%3DMTgyZjFlN2Q0YjlkYTIwZGJhZGYwODgwMmY3NGVmMTZiYTE2ZmM0NmJkOTU5ZjFmYWIxODk2ODc1ODU1MzhiOA%3D%3D%26p%3DYzJlOmN0aXNnOmM6bzo1YzhiZTgyNTI3Mzg4NmRlNmNiOGIwYTMxZDhiNGVmZDp2MTpoOlQ%3D&data=05%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cdefdeee1869b4810cfa208daac274eed%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C638011582100053641%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=c8nKAJKyLdb4ZFgdAq0ATcSHxI4Q1puY6XSCMEX%2FCoY%3D&reserved=0
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fcheckpoint.url-protection.com%2Fv1%2Furl%3Fo%3Dhttps%253A%2F%2Fapc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com%2F%253Furl%253Dhttp%25253A%25252F%25252Fwww.facebook.com%25252Fchinataipingsg%25252F%2526amp%253Bdata%253D04%25257C01%25257Cbilly.tan%252540sg.cntaiping.com%25257C0309f205d55741ffe05e08d8edcfaeac%25257C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%25257C0%25257C0%25257C637520823662361217%25257CUnknown%25257CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%25253D%25257C1000%2526amp%253Bsdata%253Dn3ueKmJmptrp5UEi%25252F3j8RyrtHgd4YbPgSvlPPMHxmpw%25253D%2526amp%253Breserved%253D0%26g%3DOGUwMjA2YmJiNzNjZWFiMw%3D%3D%26h%3DNTBjZTM0MjQ1NzFkNzEzYWE3ODNlZjJjZjUwYmY2MTVlZTRjOWE1YzEzMWQyMGRlZTcxZDZiZmNhMzMwNDRkNQ%3D%3D%26p%3DYzJlOmN0aXNnOmM6bzo1YzhiZTgyNTI3Mzg4NmRlNmNiOGIwYTMxZDhiNGVmZDp2MTpoOlQ%3D&data=05%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cdefdeee1869b4810cfa208daac274eed%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C638011582100053641%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=8aLXU4%2FcWa5RRK4C1bSE13NfWPSWtRAqx8iB%2BRENJv4%3D&reserved=0
mailto:billy.tan@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:suli@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

  
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG
 
Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any
copies of it thereafter.
 
From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 29 October 2021 1:31 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA 3373J (OI : CTI - TBA) and SHC 7506B (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI21011047/ps3) on 28/10/2021
 

 

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

 

We have received a new assignment from M/s BIFROST AUTO PTE LTD on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

 

Enclosed for your perusal is:

-              TP GIA report  

 

Note : no survey done yet.

 

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

 

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

 

Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference number and a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our
necessary action.

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong.

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

 

 

https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fcheckpoint.url-protection.com%2Fv1%2Furl%3Fo%3Dhttp%253A%2F%2Fwww.sg.cntaiping.com%26g%3DMjgwMjY2ZGVlMWI5NjIxYw%3D%3D%26h%3DNjZjOTFkNTM3NjE4OTgxMDE0OTM3OWYzNjYyODlhNGRmOGFiZDIwMDk1ZjNhY2M2MTkxM2I5YjMyNTliM2RkYw%3D%3D%26p%3DYzJlOmN0aXNnOmM6bzo1YzhiZTgyNTI3Mzg4NmRlNmNiOGIwYTMxZDhiNGVmZDp2MTpoOlQ%3D&data=05%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cdefdeee1869b4810cfa208daac274eed%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C638011582100053641%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=C3MQI5YI%2FdmE8GBncdxcjn3A65MTxE7785vvhauUze4%3D&reserved=0
https://apc01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fcheckpoint.url-protection.com%2Fv1%2Furl%3Fo%3Dhttp%253A%2F%2Fwww.facebook.com%2Fchinataipingsg%2F%26g%3DYzM3NDIxZTdiZGE3MDM1Yw%3D%3D%26h%3DMjdiNWU2YTdhZGI4MTcxOGE3Y2E3ZGY5MGUxNGFjZGYyYjEyYTQ5MTkyNDg4MDExMGY2NDhhNjY2Mzc2M2YzNw%3D%3D%26p%3DYzJlOmN0aXNnOmM6bzo1YzhiZTgyNTI3Mzg4NmRlNmNiOGIwYTMxZDhiNGVmZDp2MTpoOlQ%3D&data=05%7C01%7Cclaimsdept%40sg.cntaiping.com%7Cdefdeee1869b4810cfa208daac274eed%7C52fbc9ef9a574c5ba4ca46f2633868e5%7C0%7C0%7C638011582100053641%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJWIjoiMC4wLjAwMDAiLCJQIjoiV2luMzIiLCJBTiI6Ik1haWwiLCJXVCI6Mn0%3D%7C3000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=rRzP2ZYrjDVhdRrxkGfVeAc%2BML9Cg5caC9cQ2VcZ67w%3D&reserved=0
mailto:suli@lkkauto.com
mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
mailto:admin-a@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

                                                              

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
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