12/4/21, 12:05 PM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH0882 SGQ5959D & XD3883T DOA 26/10/2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21011032/Epa3q2

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sat 4/12/2021 12:05 PM

To: Wah Hong motors & credit pte Itd <motor@wahhong.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties

resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not

bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will be in
softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wah Hong motors & credit pte Itd <motor@wahhong.sg>

Sent: Friday, 3 December 2021 9:55 am

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH0882 SGQ5959D & XD3883T DOA 26/10/2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21011032/Epa3q2

Hi Hsiao Tong
We accept the offer, THANK YOU.

On 3/12/2021 8:32 am, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) wrote:

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $2,516.21 ($2,351.60 + 7%GST)
2. Loss of Rental (3days x $100.00) S 300.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee S 2.00

Total | $2,818.21

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably

without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages,
either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

5(408933)
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 1:22 PM

To: Wah Hong motors & credit pte Itd <motor@wahhong.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH0882 SGQ5959D & XD3883T DOA 26/10/2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/LPC21011032/Epa3q2

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi HT,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Wah Hong motors & credit pte Itd [mailto:motor@wahhong.sg]

Sent: Thursday, November 25, 2021 1:14 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: LOD & INV : OUR REF WH0882 SGQ5959D & XD3883T DOA 26/10/2021

Hi
Attached are the LOD & Invoices for your kind perusal.
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Thank you and best regards

Jenny Ng
Admin Manager

Wah Hong Motors & Credit Pte. Ltd.
Roc: 199806235M

Enterprise Hub
38 Toh Guan Road East
#01-38 5(608581)

Tel: (69) 6773 7377

Hp: (65) 8778 3555

Website: www.wahhong.sg
Email: : motor@wahhong.sg

hAAFE, Qs

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The Informatien contained in this email is intended onhy for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is priviedge, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not intended recipient, you are hereby nofified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication
iz strictly prohibited, If you have received thiz message in eroor, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail.

Data Privacy Protection Notice:
VWah Hong Motors & Credit Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purpose stated in our Privacy Policy.

This may include dizsclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and
agents (acting on cur behalf).

Thank you and best regards

Jenny Ng
Admin Manager

Wah Hong Motors & Credit Pte. Ltd.
Roc: 199806235M

Enterprise Hub
38 Toh Guan Road East
#01-38 5(608581)

Tel: (63) 6773 7377

Hp: (65) 8778 3555

Website: www.wahhong.sg
Email: : motor@@wahhong.sg

hAFE, Qs

CONFIDENTIAL NOTE:

The Informaticn contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain informatien that is priviledge, cenfidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message iz net intended recipient, vou are hereby notified that any diszemination, distribution or copying of this communication
iz strictly prohibited, If you have received this message in eroor, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail.

Data Privacy Protection Notice:
Wah Hong Motors & Credit Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purpose stated in our Privacy Policy.

Thiz may include disclesure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/reguired by laws, our third party service providers and
agents (acting on our behalf}.
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