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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: keith Lian <claims@teamworkgarage.com>
Sent: Monday, June 6, 2022 6:08 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21011026/Vra3

Categories: HMK

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Cecelia , 
 
We have passed this case to our lawyer to proceed further for this case. 
 
Thank you and have a nice day. 
 
Keith Lian 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24 
Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 6844 2475  
Fax:6844 2474 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Monday, 6 June 2022 10:32 am 
To: TEAMWORK; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21011026/Vra3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Shu Shan,  
 
We are pleased to offer GS $ 3,500.00 (all-in).  
 
Kindly confirm acceptance.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 30 March 2022 11:25 AM 
To: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21011026/Vra3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Hi Shu Shan,  
 
As refer to our insured video footage, he was travelling within lane.  
 
For fair and amicably settlement, BOLA S9e apply as both parties are turning at junction. Both parties should exercise 
caution when turning in the same direction.  
 
In view of above, we maintained our stand.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 30 March 2022 11:13 am 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21011026/Vra3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Kindly refer to attached our client’s video footage. 
 
It is clearly showed that your insured swerved into our client’s lane and caused the collision. 
 
Hence, we do not accept the liability at 50%. 
 
Thank you and have a nice day. 
 
Regards, 
 
Shu Shan 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24/34 
Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 6844 2475  
Fax:6844 2474 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Wednesday, March 30, 2022 8:41 AM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); TEAMWORKGARAGE 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21011026/Vra3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Letitia,  
 
We refer to the above matter 
 
Attached is a copy of our insured video footage and report for your easy reference.  
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Based on both parties video footage, both your client and our insured are turning.  
 
In view of above, BOLA S9e apply.  
 
Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the above 
matter without resort to litigation, we are prepared to offer 50% towards your client's claim. 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 9:35 pm 
To: TEAMWORKGARAGE <claims@teamworkgarage.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21011026/Vra3  
 
Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
This case has been reassigned to Cecilia. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Cecilia, 
 
Kindly assist. 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: TEAMWORKGARAGE [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, March 29, 2022 5:02 PM 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: TEAMWORK <claims@teamworkgarage.com> 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M  
 
Without prejudice 
 
Dear sir /mdm , 
 
We refer to the matter above , we would like to remind you guys that we have yet to receive any offer from you guys. 
 
Please let us have your most favourable offer soonest 
 
 
Thank you and have a nice day! 😊 
 
Letitia 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore (408934) 
Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 
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From: TEAMWORKGARAGE 
Sent: Tuesday, 15 February 2022 5:54 pm 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto); 'Admin A' 
Cc: TEAMWORK 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M  
 
Without prejudice 
 
Dear sir /mdm , 
 
We refer to the matter above , we would like to remind you guys that we have yet to receive any offer from you guys. 
 
Please let us have your most favorable offer soonest. 
 
Thank you and have a nice day! 😊 
 
Letitia 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore (408934) 
Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 
 

From: TEAMWORKGARAGE 
Sent: Wednesday, 19 January 2022 6:07 pm 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto); 'Admin A' 
Cc: TEAMWORK 
Subject: RE: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M  
 
Without prejudice 
 
Dear sir /mdm , 
 
We refer to the matter above , we would like to remind you guys that we have yet to receive any offer from you guys. 
 
Please let us have your most favorable offer soonest. 
 
Thank you and have a nice day! 😊 
 
Letitia 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-24 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore (408934) 
Tel: 6844 2475|Fax: 6844 2474 
 

From: Darren 
Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 4:36 pm 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto); 'Admin A' 
Cc: Darren 
Subject: LETTER OF DEMAND FOR SFC988M  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Dear Jaslin, 
 
Kindly refer to attached necessary documents for LOD submission. 
 
Please let us have the offer soonest. 
 
Darren 
Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd 
53 Ubi Avenue 1 
#01-24/#01-34 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
Singapore 408934 
Tel: 68442475 
Fax: 68442474 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 


