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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 22 June 2022 11:45
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A
Subject: RE: {MANDATE REQUEST] RE: (LOD) - OUR REF M3335 SLE4491X THIRD P VEHICLE 

YN6719B DOA 21-Oct-21 Our Ref: 21/21/21/VC05/025068

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Asher 
 
Please proceed. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/06 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 21 June 2022 2:04 pm 
To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: {MANDATE REQUEST] RE: (LOD) - OUR REF M3335 SLE4491X THIRD P VEHICLE YN6719B DOA 21-Oct-21 Our 
Ref: 21/21/21/VC05/025068 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have highlighted to your good office on 27/10/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 
 
The accident occurred when our insured reversed and collided third party vehicle. 
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
Summary to offer to repairer AUTO INSURE PTE LTD is as follows: - 
 

 Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
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1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 3,945.05 $ 1,819.00 
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $120) $    960.00 $    400.00 (4days x $100) 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        2.00 $       2.00 

Total $ 4,905.05 $ 2,221.00 
 
**2 days recommendation for repair. 
 
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 
 
Kindly note that this inspection report dated 21/06/2022 is only for mandate purpose. 
 
The above is for your approval please. 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 10:26 
To: AutoInsure (Claims) <claims01@autoinsure.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) 
<AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: (LOD) - OUR REF M3335 SLE4491X THIRD P VEHICLE YN6719B DOA 21-Oct-21 Our Ref: 
21/21/21/VC05/025068 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mae 
 
Please liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/06 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

From: AutoInsure (Claims) <claims01@autoinsure.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 3:26 PM 
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To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: (LOD) - OUR REF M3335 SLE4491X THIRD P VEHICLE YN6719B DOA 21-Oct-21 
 
 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear All, 
 
We enclosed herewith a copy of our letter of demand and our client's supporting documents for your perusal. 

Thank You. 
 
Regards 
Mae 
 
did: (65) 3157 2624 / 3157 2628 
mobile: (65) 9743 6363 
e: claims01@autoinsure.com.sg 
 
Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. 
201437380M 
6 Marsiling Lane S739145 
 
t: (65) 3157 2626 
f: (65) 6368 0081 
w: www.autoinsure.com.sg 
g.e: claims@autoinsure.com.sg 

 

-- Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is 

privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that 

any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the 

sender and delete the mail.-- 
Data Privacy Policy Notice: Auto Insure Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes stated in our Privacy Policy. This may 
include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers 
and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for our Privacy Policy. 

 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 


