Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 23 November 2021 10:37 AM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SJT 4169Y-DOA: 24/10/21

Dear Veron,

Pursuant to our texted messages yesterday, we confirmed COR at $3,450 (before GST) and 5 days.
Warmest regards,
Steven

Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd
82636295

On Friday, 19 November 2021, 11:48:04 am SGT, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jenny,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Kindly confirmed LS $3450/ 5 days

Parts-$3018.65 (less 10%)=$2716.78
SN-$136
Labour-$1470

Total-$4322.78 (less LS 20%) =$3458.22



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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