Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 November 2021 9:13 AM

To: Catherine Chong Kai Ling

Cc: Ramesh; Hasrianah Binte Hassan; Liew Si Ming; Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: YQ 4370U

Hi Catherine,

Finalised amount of $ 2,489.01 / 3 days of part by part repair is confirmed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

ZERIS WET Sgve the Larthe Print only when necessary:

From: Catherine Chong Kai Ling [mailto:CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 22 November, 2021 3:31 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: Ramesh; Hasrianah Binte Hassan; Liew Si Ming

Subject: RE: YQ 4370U

Dear Rasul,
Kindly confirm Finalise COR @ P/P: $2,489.01 (before GST) with 3 working days.
Thank you.

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!

I
GOLD[ Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd

cowesi. ENGINE |

| | f: | w: www.goldbell.com.sg

Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator



WE'RE MORE THAN JUST INDUSTRIAL VEHICLES.
WE'RE AN ECOSYSTEM THAT CONNECTS EVERYONE.

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 9, 2021 9:18 AM

To: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>

Cc: Ramesh <Ramesh@goldbell.com.sg>; Hasrianah Binte Hassan <Hasrianah@goldbell.com.sg>; Liew Si Ming
<LiewSiMing@goldbell.com.sg>

Subject: RE: YQ 4370U

Hi Catherine,

Refer to attachment

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

FEIES 2
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From: Catherine Chong Kai Ling [mailto:CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 8 November, 2021 3:53 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Ramesh; Hasrianah Binte Hassan; Liew Si Ming

Subject: RE: YQ 4370U

Dear Rasul,
As per conversation thru whatsapp, kindly assist mark the attached supplementary estimate.
Thank you.

NOTICE:
Due to the current COVID-19 situation, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delays are to be expected.
All correspondence should be done via email instead. Thank you for staying safe with us!

I
GOLD[ Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd
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Distribution | Leasing | Financial Services | Tech-enabled Core | Venture Build | Investments | Accelerator



WE'RE MORE THAN JUST INDUSTRIAL VEHICLES.
WE'RE AN ECOSYSTEM THAT CONNECTS EVERYONE.

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 2, 2021 10:13 AM

To: Hasrianah Binte Hassan <Hasrianah@goldbell.com.sg>

Cc: Catherine Chong Kai Ling <CatherineChongKL@goldbell.com.sg>
Subject: YQ 4370U

Hi Hasrianah,

Refer to attachment for the revised estimate

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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