Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Trident Auto <tridentauto.claims@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 12:13 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMX 4920M FINALISE

Dear Taufikh,

We accept the offer $2400 with 3 days.

Warmest Regards,
ZHE CHIAN

Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd

8 Kaki bukit Ave 4 #02-42 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

T (65)63441918 F (65) 6744 9778

DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not
misuse, copy, disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If
you are not the intended recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. The sender shall
not be liable for any loss or damage caused by viruses transmitted by this e-mail or its attachments. As the integrity of
this message cannot be guaranteed, The sender shall not be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in this emalil
may not necessarily represent the opinion of TRIDENT AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

On Fri, May 13, 2022 at 5:33 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

“Without Prejudice”

Please refer attached, we will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of lumpsum $2400/- with 3 days of
repair, subject to their approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Trident Auto [mailto:tridentauto.claims@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 21 April 2022 10:35 AM




To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)
Cc: veronchen@Ilkkauto.com
Subject: Re: SMX 4920M FINALISE

Hi Taufikh,

Is it possible to increase L/S $26507?

Warmest Regards,
ZHE CHIAN

Trident Auto Service Centre Pte Ltd

8 Kaki bukit Ave 4 #02-42 Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

T (65)63441918  F (65) 6744 9778

DISCLAIMER

Any person receiving this email and any attachment(s) contained, shall treat the information as confidential and not
misuse, copy, disclose, distribute or retain the information in any way that amounts to a breach of confidentiality. If
you are not the intended recipient, please delete all copies of this email from your computer system. The sender
shall not be liable for any loss or damage caused by viruses transmitted by this e-mail or its attachments. As the
integrity of this message cannot be guaranteed, The sender shall not be responsible for the contents. Any opinion in
this email may not necessarily represent the opinion of TRIDENT AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

On Wed, Mar 30, 2022 at 4:12 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

“Without Prejudice”

Please refer attached, we will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of lumpsum $2150/- with 3 days

of repair, subject to their approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto



