EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: Roasted Porky <roastedporky@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 November 2022 2:50 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ7725U (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHD9953A AT/ALONG

CTE ON 22/10/2021

Hi Ezlyna,

Nice speaking to you earlier. With references to your email dated 16 Nov 2022, | would like to highlight and bring
attention to the following points:

1) it has been a year plus than | received this email about third party claim.

2) I refute the claim as | have stated in the accident report that | have not hit the vehicle infront.
3) My lawyers have already settled all issues recently.

4) My workshop claim and insurance report shows no damage to my front at all.

5) This could be a insurance fraud.

Please note my accident report and | standby my report. If need be, | will make a police report to certify this.

Lastly, there should be “no” third party claim as | have not hit the vehicle infront and | don’t want to have my future
insurance tinted by this false claim. Please note important.

Thank you.

Regards
Wen Hui

On 16 Nov 2022, at 14:23, EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC3/CTI21010975/Kga3

Insured Name : ROSTED PORKY
Insured Driver : Tan Boon Wee

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ7725U (CHINA TAIPING) AND SHD9953A AT/ALONG CTE ON
22/10/2021

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the
third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SHD9953 A against your motor insurance policy.



Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your
driver’s favour. Therefore, we shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third
party claim at best to avoid further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@lkkauto.com |

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)




