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07/07/2022



J.E.W. MOTORS PTE. LTD. 
Co. Reg. No. : 202136089E 
 

6001 Beach Road #22-01, Golden Mile Tower, Singapore 199589     email: claims@jewmotors.com 

Tax Invoice 
  

AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD  
8 Shenton Way, 
#24-01 AXA Tower,  
Singapore 068811 

Inv. No. :  
Inv. Date : 

Ref : 
Terms : 

Veh. No. :  
Make & Model 

: 

BA.JM.202203001 
02-07-2022 
23/10/2021 

14 Days 
SKE6681M 

TOYOTA PRIUS 

 
 

# Description Qty Rate Total Tax 

1 Repair Cost 1.0 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $0.00 

 
 
Remarks: 
SKE6681M  

 
Subtotal for invoice : S$3,700.00 

Total : S$3,700.00 

 
I agree to the price as listed above and 
affirm that the goods are received in good 
condition. 

 On behalf of J.E.W. MOTORS PTE. LTD. 

 
 
 
 

  

(Customer’s Signature and Company Stamp)  (Authorised Signature) 

 
Please make cheque payable to “J.E.W. MOTORS PTE LTD” and mail to 6001 BEACH ROAD #22-
01, GOLDEN MILE TOWER Singapore 199589 or direct bank transfer to DBS Bank Current 
Account 072-483-495-0. 
 
 
The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages 
arising therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document. 
 
GST at 7% is charged where applicable 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 22 December 2021 13:55
To: tayyinji@gmail.com
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH 9184J AND SKE 6681M ALONG YISHUN ST 51 ON 

23/10/2021

22 DEC 2021 

  

TAY SOON HEE /  TAY YIN JI 

Dear Sir/ Mdm 

OUR REF       : CC4/ASM21010953/Eea3 

YOUR REF     : SLH 9184J 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH 9184J AND SKE 6681M ALONG YISHUN ST 51 ON 23/10/2021 

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your 
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.  

We have received a claim from M/s J.E.W MOTORS PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SKE 6681M 
against your motor insurance policy. 

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had rear-ended the Third 
Party vehicle SKE 6681M. As such, liability is down against us. 

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your 
policy. 

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded 
under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party 
claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 days from the date 
of this letter.  Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.  

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to 
ashersng@lkkauto.com within 7 days from the date of this letter if not provided at our reporting centre. The 
list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:  

 Letter of authorisation with signature from TAY SOON HEE that the driver TAY YIN JI is authorise 
to drive the vehicle at the time of the accident. 

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third 
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior 
knowledge and consent.  
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This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any 
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.  

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final 
indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).   

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at 
ashersng@lkkauto.com.  

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively. 

  

Yours sincerely, 

  

Asher 

Case Handler 

Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com 

c.c.      AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (AXA) 

             (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 12 May 2022 13:53
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Subject: FW: New message for service request 234083, vehicle number SKE6681M

12/5/22 1:00 PM  *** pls proceed - NG Stacey 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: stacey.ng@axa.com.sg <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, 12 May 2022 1:00 PM 
To: admin-d@lkkauto.com 
Subject: New message for service request 234083, vehicle number SKE6681M 
 
AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S1M03KNQ. 
Please click here https://vendor.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/ClaimApplication/dist/html/index-vendor.html to view the 
message in Vendor Portal. 
 
This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a 
written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is 
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately. 
 




