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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 28 October 2021 1:40 PM
To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY -   XE4383H, doa 25.9.2021 (AIG Insured - SLS9332R) LKK 

REF : CC4/AIG21010905/gs3

Categories: LSL

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir / Madam,  
 
Please refer to the below OI’s sketch plan and statement. 
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Please note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Cecilia via email. 
  
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
  
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
  
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
                                                               

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li| Admin Support 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
 

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, October 28, 2021 12:38 PM 
To: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - XE4383H, doa 25.9.2021 (AIG Insured - SLS9332R) LKK REF : CC4/AIG21010905/gs3  
  
Resend. 
 
Please ignore the previous email. 
 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sir / Madam,  
 
Thank you for your email. 
 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 
 
Hi Cecilia, 
 
FYNA, CC4/AIG21010905/gs3 
 
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
  
  
*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
                                                               

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li| Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 
 

From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg> 
Sent: Thursday, October 28, 2021 12:03 PM 
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: ENQUIRY OF LIABILITY - XE4383H, doa 25.9.2021 (AIG Insured - SLS9332R)  
  
HI, 
  
Attached our client report. 
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Pls let us have a copy of the statement/sketch plan of SLS9332R if you have it. 
  
ALSO, pls advise who is the claim handler? 
  
Thank you. 
 
Rgds 
June 
Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd 
Tel : 67556142 
Fax : 67557719 
Email- chmotor@singnet.com.sg 
  
From: June Phua ( Cheng Hoe Motor)  
Sent: Friday, October 22, 2021 5:43 PM 
To: Subramaniam, Divyashni  
Cc: Lim, Kok-Chong ; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa ; Hor, Yinrul ; Teo, Ericweihong  
Subject: Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - XE4383H 
  
  
  
Dear Sir 
  
  
OUR CLIENT   –  XE4383H  
DATE OF ACCIDENT :  25/9/21 @ 1150hrs 
YOUR  
INS 
URED :    SLS9332R 
  
  
  
Kindly provide us your surveyor listing for the selection on the survey.  
Thank you.  
 
Regards 
June 
Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd 
Tel :67556142 
Fax : 67557719 
  


