Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Cc:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Wednesday, 10 August 2022 2:52 PM
YT(MG)

Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); YT(KB)

RE: liability for FBQ4145B

DV_FBQ 4145B.pdf

We confirm settlement at a global sum of $2,950.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred

from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 10 August 2022 10:56 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ilkkauto.com>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB)

<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Importance: High
Hi Hsiao Tong,

Ok accept.

Kindly please let us have the payment or bank transfer details soon.



Thank you

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD

—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:

39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61
Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)
Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 August 2022 8:36 am
To: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; 'YT(KB)' <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB)

<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $2,950.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 5 August 2022 4:56 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; 'YT(KB)' <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>; YT(MG)
<utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Hi Hsiao Tong,
We counter offer $3,000 (all-in).

Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:

Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

&5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 August 2022 4:27 pm

To: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; YT(KB) <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Apologised for late response.

We propose settlement at a global sum of $2,900.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 3 August 2022 1:52 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com>; YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB)
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>




Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B
Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Await your reply soon with regards to our LOD sent in 30/06/2022.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

&5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 2:56 pm
To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B
Hi Hsiao Tong,
Based on your email 05/11/2021, liability is cleared as stated by you.

Is there any issues?



Please advise.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD

Y

YT

NORTH HQ Office: EAST Branch Office:
Mega@Woodlands Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
39 Woodlands Close #01-12 Unit No #01-61

Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

&5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 14 July 2022 2:29 pm

To: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: YT(KB) <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Apologised for late response.

Kindly provide a copy of police investigation result for our necessary action.

Thank you.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 July 2022 4:28 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Kindly please let us have your reply soon.

Thank you /N

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com
Website: www.yewteegroup.com
Like Us On Facebook

Director of
-YEW TEE AUTOMOBILE TECH PTE LTD




NORTH HQ Office:
Mega@Woodlands

39 Woodlands Close #01-12
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg

EAST Branch Office:

Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
Unit No #01-61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)

Fax: 6702 3773
Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

&5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 30 June 2022 9:20 pm

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; YT(KB) <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Importance: High

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Attached LOD and other documents for your kind perusal.
We will mail the originals to your good office later.

Kindly please let us have your reply soon.

Thank you. @ &\

Best Regards

Mobile: 9747 1475

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Website: www.yewteegroup.com

Like Us On Facebook

Director of

-YEW TEE AUTOMOSBILE TECH PTE LTD

—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

NORTH HQ Office:
Mega@Woodlands
39 Woodlands Close #01-12

EAST Branch Office:

Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road 4
Unit No #01-61



Singapore 737856 Singapore 417800

DID: 6256 2081 (3 Lines) DID: 6702 3113 (3 Lines)
Fax: 6256 2533 Fax: 6702 3773
Email: utauto@singnet.com.sg Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

&5 please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the
identified recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this
message from your system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 5 November 2021 10:17 am

To: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; YTKB <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Without Prejudice
Hi,

Our insured had reported the accident. Attached is a copy for your easy reference.
Based on accident report, liability is in your client’s favour.

Cn the above mentionad date

time and location

| was driving along Jurong West Street 833, Whean | was about to make a right turn into Caltex patrol station

a red motarcycla baaring numbear (FBLY 1438) hit onto my left rear bumper of my wvehicla. My car suffered slight damage on tha |
bumper and the motorcycle suffered damage on the front side of his bike. | did not have amy injuries but the rider sustained abra:

and cut on the left forearm. Particulars for both parties were exchanged. | have in-car camera footage of the incidant. | wish to st
| am ladging this report as | am unsure what might happen.



SKETCH PLAN

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 2 November 2021 8:08 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; YTKB <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>;

10



YTHQ <utauto@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Does your insured done the accident report. Please advise on the liability.

Meantime, we are still waiting for the police investigation result.

Thank You @

Best Regards

Ms Lai Yee Meng

o

—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):

39 Woodlands Close,

#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 28 October 2021 5:11 PM

To: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB'
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: liability for FBQ4145B

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

11



We are in the midst of engaging our insured on this third-party claim as he is of the view that he is not fully liable.
Meantime, kindly advise if there is any PIR from your client.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 October 2021 4:47 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YTKB
<utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YTHQ <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Hi,
Any update for this?
Thank you.

Best Regards

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):
39 Woodlands Close,

12



#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 October 2021 12:25 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YTKB <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YTHQ
<utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Hi,
Any update for this?

Thank you.

Best Regards

—_—
TOLE Toudiio pay iy

YT

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):

39 Woodlands Close,

#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road

13



Unit No #01-60/61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 4:42 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>; YTKB <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>; YTHQ <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: liability for FBQ4145B

Hi LKk,
Attached our client GIA report as per request,

Thank you.

Best Regards

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):

39 Woodlands Close,

#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

14



From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 8:26 AM

To: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-

a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle FBQ4145B

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We are pending for a copy of our insured accident from our principal.

We will get back to you asap.

Meantime, kindly provide a copy of your client’s accident report for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 8:18 AM

To: 'YT(MG)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@I|kkauto.com>; 'YTKB' <utauto2 @singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle FBQ4145B

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Thank you for your email.

15



Daer Hsiao Tong,
Kindly assist.

FYNA Our Ref : CC4/A1G21010862/pa3

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 October, 2021 6:58 PM

To: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; YTKB <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YTHQ <utauto@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle FBQ4145B

Hi Summer,
Kindly let us have the liability soon.
Thank You @

Best Regards

Ms Lai Yee Meng

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):

39 Woodlands Close,

#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

16



Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: YT(MG) <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 11:30 AM

To: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>; YTKB <utauto2@singnet.com.sg>; YTHQ <utauto@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle FBQ4145B

Hi Summer,

Noted.

Thank You @

Best Regards

Ms Lai Yee Meng

Yew Tee Automobile Tech Pte Ltd
HQ Office (North):

39 Woodlands Close,

#01-12 Mega@Woodlands
Singapore 737856

DID: 6256 2081

Fax: 6256 2533

Email: info@yewteegroup.com

Branch Office (East):
Synergy@KB, 25 Kaki Bukit Road
Unit No #01-60/61

Singapore 417800

DID: 6702 3113

Email: utauto2@singnet.com.sg

b% please consider the environment before printing this email

Notice : This mail (including all attachments) contains confidential information which may be privileged. It is intended solely for the identified
recipient(s) to whom it is addressed. If you are not an intended recipient, please reply to us immediately and delete this message from your
system. You may not copy or use it for any purpose, or otherwise disclose its contents to any person.

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 10:52 AM

To: 'YT(HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Survey Vehicle FBQ4145B

Dear Yee Meng,
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Please be inform that | assign Taufikh to survey this motorbike.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 22 October, 2021 9:58 AM

To: 'YT(HQ)' <utauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Survey Vehicle FBQ4145B

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Is the vehicle FBQ 4145B in the workshop?

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.
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