Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 November 2021 4:08 PM

To: thpang71@yahoo.com.sg

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 7175T AND SML 9922M ON 13/10/2021

Our Ref: CC6/CTI21010844/Aea3

18 NOV 2021

PANG TOON HAN

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKP 7175T AND SML 9922M ON 13/10/2021

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher
Case Handler
Email: ashersng@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 12 December 2022 3:06 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: FW: REMINDER - FOR OFFER || VLL: DA1-YLV-INS-H47-117932-22-FG || CNTP:

SNM21D206032/C02/SKP7175T/LEEPG || ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 9922 M &
SKP 7175 T ON 13-OCT-2021 ALONG NEAR 49 PHENG GECK AVENUE AT ABOUT
1936 HOURS

Hi LKK
We’ll handle the claim.

Please submit your tax invoice for survey fee.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Cecilia Lee

Senior Executive
Claims Department

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Ernie <ernie@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 December 2022 6:16 pm

To: Cecilia Lee <cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; 'Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Yvonne Lim' <yvonnelim@visionlawllc.com>; angkimnoi@visionlawllc.com

Subject: RE: REMINDER - FOR OFFER || VLL: DA1-YLV-INS-H47-117932-22-FG | | CNTP: SKP 7175 T | | ACCIDENT
INVOLVING SML 9922 M & SKP 7175 T ON 13-OCT-2021 ALONG NEAR 49 PHENG GECK AVENUE AT ABOUT 1936
HOURS

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref: DA1-ylv-Ins-H47-117932-22-er

Dear Sir/Mdm
We refer to the above matter and to our emails dated 13.09.2022, 27.09.2022 and 03.11.2022 below.
We regret to note that we have yet to hear from you.

Should you still be inclined to settle our client’s claim, please let us have your favourable settlement proposal within
7 days hereof.

Thank you.
Regards,

Ernie (Secretary)



Vision Law LLC

133 New Bridge Road
#18-01/02 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 6534 2811 (Ext. 146)
Fax: 6535-6802

From: Cecilia Lee [mailto:cecilia.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 November, 2022 9:56 AM

To: Ernie; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: 'Yvonne Lim'; angkimnoi@visionlawllc.com

Subject: RE: FOR OFFER || VLL: DA1-YLV-INS-H47-117932-22-FG || CNTP: SKP 7175 T | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML
9922 M & SKP 7175 T ON 13-OCT-2021 ALONG NEAR 49 PHENG GECK AVENUE AT ABOUT 1936 HOURS

Without Prejudice

Dear Ernie

We are looking into the matter. Please bear with us a little longer.

Copy to Hsiao Tong, for your follow up action please.

NOTICE :

In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be

expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email
claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Cecilia Lee

Senior Executive
Claims Department

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender
immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Ernie <ernie@visionlawllc.com>

Sent: Thursday, 3 November 2022 5:50 pm

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Yvonne Lim' <yvonnelim@visionlawllc.com>; angkimnoi@visionlawllc.com

Subject: RE: FOR OFFER || VLL: DA1-YLV-INS-H47-117932-22-FG || CNTP: SKP 7175 T | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML
9922 M & SKP 7175 T ON 13-OCT-2021 ALONG NEAR 49 PHENG GECK AVENUE AT ABOUT 1936 HOURS

CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization. Do not click links or open attachments unless you
recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref: DA1-ylv-Ins-H47-117932-22-er

Dear Sir/Mdm

We refer to the above matter and to our emails dated 13.09.2022 and 27.09.2022 below.



Should you still be inclined to settle our client’s claim, please let us have your favourable settlement proposal within
7 days hereof.

Thank you.

Regards,

Ernie (Secretary)

Vision Law LLC

133 New Bridge Road
#18-01/02 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 6534 2811 (Ext. 146)
Fax: 6535-6802

From: Ernie [mailto:ernie@visionlawllc.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 27 September, 2022 7:36 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'

Cc: 'Yvonne Lim'; 'angkimnoi@visionlawllc.com'

Subject: RE: FOR OFFER | | VLL: DA1-YLV-INS-H47-117932-22-FG | | CNTP: SKP 7175 T | | ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML
9922 M & SKP 7175 T ON 13-OCT-2021 ALONG NEAR 49 PHENG GECK AVENUE AT ABOUT 1936 HOURS

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref: DA1-ylv-Ins-H47-117932-22-er

Dear Sir/Mdm
We refer to the above matter.

Should you still be inclined to settle our client’s claim, please let us have your favorable settlement proposal within 7
days hereof.

Thank you.

Regards,

Ernie (Secretary)

Vision Law LLC

133 New Bridge Road
#18-01/02 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 6534 2811 (Ext. 146)
Fax: 6535-6802

From: Felicia [mailto:feliciagoh@visionlawllc.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 13 September, 2022 10:05 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'

Cc: 'Yvonne Lim'; 'angkimnoi@visionlawllc.com'

Subject: RE: LOQ | | VLL: DA1-YLV-INS-H47-117932-22-FG || CNTP: SKP 7175 T || ACCIDENT INVOLVING SML 9922
M & SKP 7175 T ON 13-OCT-2021 ALONG NEAR 49 PHENG GECK AVENUE AT ABOUT 1936 HOURS

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
OUR REF: DA1-YLV-INS-H47-117932-22-FG



Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
We enclose herein our Letter of Demand dated 13 September 2022 for your attention.

Thank you.

Regards,

Felicia Goh (Secretary)

Vision Law LLC

133 New Bridge Road
#18-01/02 Chinatown Point
Singapore 059413

Tel: 6534-2811 Fax: 6535-6802

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for the
recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing and/or
disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any

person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any errors or
omissions in the contents resulting from email

transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.

VISION LAW LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

(Incorporated with limited liability)

Unique Entity No. 200721148H

Address : 133 New Bridge Road #18-01/02 Chinatown Point, Singapore 059413

DISCLAIMER:

The contents of this email (including any attachments) are confidential and privileged and only intended for the
recipient(s) addressed above. If you received this email

by error, please notify the sender immediately and destroy it (and all attachments) without reading, storing and/or



disseminating any of its contents (in any form) to any
person. Email communication is not secure. Vision Law LLC is not liable for any losses arising out of any errors or

omissions in the contents resulting from email
transmission or any illegal or unauthorised usage or tampering of its email system.




