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Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: joshua@falconair.com.sg
Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 8:58 AM
To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto); SUR
Cc: anna@falconair.com.sg
Subject: RE: OD / SMQ 1205B / DOA 19/10/2021

Dear Hui Zhen, 
 
Confirm COR part by part $7,719.53(before GST and excess) and 6 repair days. 
 
 
Thanks and regards, 
Joshua Ng 
Falcon-Air Auto Services (Tampines) 
Tel: 67897997 
 
 

From: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 24 November 2021 3:46 pm 
To: 'Joshua' <joshua@falconair.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: OD / SMQ 1205B / DOA 19/10/2021 
 
Dear Joshua,  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Confirm final fig $7719.53 before excess $500 & GST and 6 repair days. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Hui Zhen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: huizhen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 23 November 2021 4:05 PM 
To: 'Joshua' 
Subject: OD / SMQ 1205B / DOA 19/10/2021 
 
Dear Joshua, 
 
Attached as per requested. 

 

 

Best Regards, 
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Hui Zhen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: huizhen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


