Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 5:01 pm
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FBB 817B FINALISE
Attachments: FBB 817B FINALISE.JPG

Hi Shiau Chan,

Can close, workshop agree.

Regards
Taufikh

From: HKL Lim Team Motorsport [mailto:hkllimteam@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 2:36 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: FBL 817B FINALISE

agree

On Thu, 25 Nov 2021, 1:22 pm Taufikh (LKK Auto), <taufikh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Refer attached , COR P/P $1095.50, 3 DAYS.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto



