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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Khim Goh <sinhweemotor@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 November 2021 10:38 AM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Your Ref: SMF7559Z // DOA: 03/10/2021 // LKK Ref: 

CC6/AIG21010823/Upa3(SMH2577T)
Attachments: CCF02112021.pdf

Dear Hsiao Tong , 
 
Our client requested us to claim the following :- 
 
1) Cost Of Repair                      $ 2700.00 
 
2) LOU                                      $ 360.00 ($120.00 x 3days) 
 
3) LTA Fee                                $ 7.45 
 
Total amount                            $ 3067.45 
 
Please kindly get back to us soon. 
 
Thanks 
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 5 November 2021 4:29 PM
To: 'ongjason13@hotmail.com'
Cc: 'Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com'
Subject: Re: 7310445567SG003 Accident Involving SMH2577T & SMF7559Z on 03/10/2021
Attachments: SP (1).JPG; SP (2).JPG; SP (3).JPG; SP (4).JPG; SP (5).JPG; SP (6).JPG; SP (7).JPG; SP 

(8).JPG; SP (9).JPG; SP (10).JPG; SP (11).JPG; SP (12).JPG; SP (13).JPG; SP (14).JPG; SP 
(15).JPG; SP (16).JPG; SP (17).JPG; SP (18).JPG; SP (19).JPG; SP (20).JPG; SP (21).JPG

Dear Mr Ong, 
 
Our surveyor had physically conducted survey to third party vehicle and is in the view that the damages sustained to 
the Third-Party vehicle is consistent to the nature of accident as reported. From your scene photo, we observe that 
third party rear bumper was dented and the impact to the rear bumper caused the edge of tailgate to be bent 
inwards slightly.  
 

 
 
The rear bumper badly dented due to impact force caused by your vehicle,  and you can look at rear bumper lower 
black area deformed which is Matt black colour and it cannot be spray painting and need to be replaced. In view of 
the nature bumper which is made of plastic material, it is not possible to restore back to pre-accident condition 
based on damage profile. 
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As for the reverse sensor which is fitted at the rear bumper, the impact caused short circuit to the sensor. Our 
surveyor who conducted inspection had tested the rear reverse sensor and confirmed that the sensor was 
intermittent malfunction. Thus, it needs to be replaced.  
 
We attached here with the damage photos during our inspection for your easy reference. Our surveyor has 
completed his assessment and adjusted repair cost at Lump Sum $2,700.00 with 3 repair days. The repair cost 
included the replacement of rear bumper, rear bumper reverse sensor, rear bumper reinforcement & labour 
charges. We shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third party claim at best to avoid further 
litigation, which would escalate to even more cost. 
 
Should you wish to further discuss on the matter, please contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Yong, Joanne-LF <Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com>  
Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 5:01 PM 
To: jason ong <ongjason13@hotmail.com> 
Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Re: 7310445567SG003 Accident Involving SMH2577T & SMF7559Z on 03/10/2021 
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Dear Jason, 
 
Refer to the above matter. 
 
We have received from this workshop Sin Hwee Motor Pte Ltd and we have appointed our surveyor M/s LKK Auto 
Consultants Pte Ltd to survey this TP vehicle. 
 
Our surveyor will contact you soon for this matter.  
 
Dear Hsiao, 
 
PLs update our insured for this matter. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best regards, 
Joanne Yong 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1953 
Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com | www.AIG.sg 
  
 
 

From: Yong, Joanne-LF  
Sent: Friday, October 22, 2021 5:26 PM 
To: jason ong <ongjason13@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: 7310445567SG003 Accident Involving SMH2577T & SMF7559Z on 03/10/2021 
 
 
 
Dear Mr. Ong, 
 
Thank you for the information that you provided. 
 
We have noted your concern. As we have spoken early on 20/10/21, we yet receive from the TP submit supporting 
claims. We will update you once we again received from the TP claimant. 
 
The liability is not in our favour for this matter, as such we will keep a reserve for this claim.  
 
Please note that your Non-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, if will be 
deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
If you have any further quires do let me know we can able to discuss on the phone.  
 
Take care and have a nice weekend ahead. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best regards, 
Joanne Yong 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 
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78 Shenton Way, Level 10 
Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1953 
Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com | www.AIG.sg 
  
 
 

From: jason ong <ongjason13@hotmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, October 20, 2021 12:25 PM 
To: Yong, Joanne-LF <Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: 7310445567SG003 Accident Involving SMH2577T & SMF7559Z on 03/10/2021 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Hi Joanne 
 
Thanks for the call. Would like to note the following concerns discussed and some queries below: 
 
1. Was informed that the other party would be changing workshop. And no claim amount has been filed yet since 
the accident on 3 October 2021. Is there a deadline for the filing of claims amount or would this be allowed to drag 
indefinitely? 
 
2. Was informed that AIG's assessor has yet to do an assessment on the damage. I am very concerned on this given 
the common malpractice of claims inflations. 
 
3. I highlighted that the other owner did not file an accident report within 24hrs. Please advise if there is any penalty 
or influence on case outcome for such non-compliances. 
 
4. I have attached some screenshots of the conversation with the owner for your refrence regarding my suspicions 
of business soliciting and pressure tactics. The authenticity of the Mazda workshop quote is unknown. 
 
5. Noted that the other party is also insired by AIG, i hope that AIG respects its own rules such as 24h accident 
reporting etc in this case. 
 
Additional questions: 
6. The impact to NCD was not mentioned earlier, may i know what is the updated NCD. 
 
7. Understand that NCD is only affected upon claim, currently there is no claims amount available and my insurance 
renewal is expected in about 2 months time. 
a. How can i decide on whether to reimburse AIG on the claims amount and preserve my NCD if the finalisation of 
claims amount is further delayed with no deadline. 
b. Will the processing of this claim be affected in any way if i change by insurer before this case is concluded. 
 
On Wed, 20 Oct 2021, 12:08 Yong, Joanne-LF, <Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com> wrote: 

Policy: 1900000228 

Vehicle: SMH2577T 

  

Dear Mr. Ong, 

  

Thank you for our earlier tele-conversation and your earlier emails.  
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We noted your concern regards to the third party claim.  

  

We will montior the claim and keep you update. 

  

If you have any additional information / evidence which could assist us in the handling of the above claim, please 
contact us within the next 7 days from the date of this email.  

  

Your No Claim Discount has been affected as a result of this claim. If you require anything further from us on this 
claim, please feel free to contact the undersigned at 6419-1953 or Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com and we will be glad to 
assist you. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Best regards, 

Joanne Yong 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner – Auto Property Damage Claims 
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
 
AIG Building 

78 Shenton Way, Level 10 

Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1953 

Joanne-LF.yong@aig.com | www.AIG.sg 
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> -. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(206063) MAZDA CX-5 2.0 PREMIUM 2WD (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Clm Created Reg No: SMF7559Z. Acct Date: 2021/10/03. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. L
td. (SG). Workshop: Sin Hwee Motor Pte Ltd (HQ)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Clm Existing
Check
Notice

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

5
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

6
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/11/01 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

7
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

8
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (E
xpress)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

9
21 Oct
2021
15:07

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

10
21 Oct
2021
15:08

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

11
21 Oct
2021
15:08

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> MARCUS CHUA [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

12
22 Oct
2021
15:59

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: - -> TAY JIA JIA, REGINA (ZHENG JIA JIA). [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

13
04 Nov
2021
11:54

Video
Downloaded Downloaded OI VIDEO [A] MARCUS

CHUA

14
04 Nov
2021
11:55

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SMF 7559Z REAR VIDEO [A] MARCUS

CHUA

15
05 Nov
2021
14:39

Video
Downloaded Downloaded OI VIDEO [I] Yong,

Joanne

16
05 Dec
2021
23:46

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

17
05 Dec
2021
23:46

Clm Dtl
Modified Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

18
05 Dec
2021
23:46

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2018/11/23.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

19
05 Dec
2021
23:46

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

20
16 Dec
2021
17:01

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:3007.45:Liability: 100%(B27)
*Quantum: (a)COR: $2,700.00 + (b)LOU(3days x $100.00):
$300.00 + (c)Search fee: $7.45 = Total: $3,007.45
*3 recommendation repair days *For your approv
al please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

21
20 Dec
2021
09:58

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/11/01 [I] Yong,
Joanne

22
20 Dec
2021
09:58

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:3007.45. [I] Yong,

Joanne

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY
[02/03/2022 16:21] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Spoken to OI Mr Ong FCOR is L/sum $2,700.000 which is adjusted from initial estimate(est $5K). We are unable to release our survey report to
him as it is remain as insurer internal official documents. However he can come to LKK office to view it. He said no need. He said that he is no
longer under AIG insured ald.



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=92385846&CFTOKEN=b448c25243f46cfb-CFC1D472-C115-9420-A6C71FBC36A839EC&USID=3251&RID=3181341
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=92385846&CFTOKEN=b448c25243f46cfb-CFC1D472-C115-9420-A6C71FBC36A839EC&USID=3251&RID=3181341
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=92385846&CFTOKEN=b448c25243f46cfb-CFC1D472-C115-9420-A6C71FBC36A839EC&USID=3251&RID=3181341
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=92385846&CFTOKEN=b448c25243f46cfb-CFC1D472-C115-9420-A6C71FBC36A839EC&USID=3251&RID=3181341&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1040624%26extid%3D372199%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=92385846&CFTOKEN=b448c25243f46cfb-CFC1D472-C115-9420-A6C71FBC36A839EC&USID=3251&RID=3181341
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(Branch)

2735255 22 Oct 2021
17:35:02

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SMF7559Z SMH2577T 11.00

2738271 03 Nov 2021
10:29:50 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SMF7559Z CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2738297 03 Nov 2021
11:07:49 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SMF7559Z CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2746619 05 Dec 2021
23:46:02

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SMF7559Z SMH2577T 11.00









