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HueyYon (LKK Auto)

To: Charandeep Singh; Claims
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments; Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: PRS survey || Claim ref: C10012122 /CD || OI-SMS3243S(Brown) TP-SLB6180X || Est: 

NIL ||Xinhua workshop
Attachments: AGI-LKKInvoice-AC2201464.pdf; GIA Rpt.pdf; LKKAdjustment.pdf; LKKInspection.pdf; 

LKKPhoto.pdf; Resurvey Photo-1.pdf; Resurvey Photo-2.pdf; Resurvey Photo-3.pdf

Dear Charan, 
 
 
Enclose Survey Report of  SLB 6180X. 
 
 
Thank you 
 
Best Regards, 

Elaine | Reports 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Fax: 6741-4108   email: report@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

 
 
From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 March 2022 5:24 PM 
To: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Claims 
<claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Reports (LKKAuto) 
<report@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PRS survey || Claim ref: C10012122 /CD || OI-SMS3243S(Brown) TP-SLB6180X || Est: NIL ||Xinhua workshop 
 
Dear Charan, 
 
 
We are in the midst of preparing report. 
 
 
Dear Report Team, 
 
Kindly expedite--- CS/AGI21010783/Avf3 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Tuesday, 15 March 2022 5:12 PM 
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; 
assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PRS survey || Claim ref: C10012122 /CD || OI-SMS3243S(Brown) TP-SLB6180X || Est: NIL ||Xinhua workshop 
 
Dear LKK Team. 
 
We have yet to receive your survey report. Third party has already sent us the LOD as attached. 
Please forward us your survey report urgently. 
 
 
Regards, 
 
Charan 
Executive, Claims 
  
T +65 6989 3694 
F +65 6725 0853  
E Charandeep.S@budgetdirect.com.sg 
   

  
 
Customer Care +65 6989 3684 
Claims +65 6989 3686 
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199 
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01 
Singapore Shopping Centre 
Singapore 
239924                                                                                                                                  
budgetdirect.com.sg 
 

 
 
Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct 
Insurance. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
From: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 20 October 2021 12:56 pm 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: PRS survey || Claim ref: C10012122 /CD || OI-SMS3243S(Brown) TP-SLB6180X || Est: NIL ||Xinhua workshop 
 
 



3

 
Dear Sir / Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your assignment. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Summer Lee | Admin 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 
S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
From: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>  
Sent: Wednesday, 20 October, 2021 12:37 PM 
To: sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; admin-d@lkkauto.com 
Cc: Charandeep Singh <charandeep.s@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Subject: PRS survey || Claim ref: C10012122 /CD || OI-SMS3243S(Brown) TP-SLB6180X || Est: NIL ||Xinhua workshop 
 

Hi Team 
 
We wish to appoint LKK to conduct PRS for this case on a without prejudice basis. 
 
TP workshop requested for Adrian Ling to survey their client’s vehicle. 

Xinhua workshop - 23,kaki Bukit Ave 4, 

#04-01(south wing)S(415933) 

 
Thanks & Rgds 
Christina 

From: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop1@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 3:50 pm 
To: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg> 
Cc: Xin Hua <xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB6180X & SMS3243S AT STADIUM BLVD ROUANDABOUT ON 16.10.2021/ 2205 

 

To the officer in charge, 

 

We are appointed workshop bearing the car plates SLB6180X ,accident happened due to the collision by your insured SMS3243S . 

Kindly help to arrange for PRI at the following address: 

 

Xinhua workshop  

Reg:201838521G 
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No 23,kaki bukit ave 4, 

#04-01(south wing) 

S(415933) 

 

Regards, 

ALLAN 

87867171 

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited, Easy 
Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in 
this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is 
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege have 
not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you are not the intended addressee, 
please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free. 
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