2/17/22,11:03 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

RE: FW: FBE 9684S DOA : 09/10/21

Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Wed 16/2/2022 5:30 PM
To: Mica Alyssa Rafidah <mica.fida@gmail.com>

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Hi Mica,

As spoken to Mr Kahar, we will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S
$1,950.00/- with 4 days of repair, subject to their approval

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Mica Alyssa Rafidah [mailto:mica.fida@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 11 November, 2021 11:24 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: FBE 9684S DOA : 09/10/21

Noted with thanks.

On Mon, 8 Nov 2021 at 10:00 AM, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 November, 2021 1:17 PM
To: mica.fida.@gmail.com

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: FBE 9684S DOA : 09/10/21

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYINGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUwWMGFhNWIXNAAQAEKNn5P9gJ0ONkfgo201KWhI...
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2/17/22,11:03 AM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook
Hi Mica,

Kindly refer to attachment for the revised estimate,

Kindly take note, this bike repair limit is up to § 3,500 only whichever lower. If repair cost more
than the repair limit,

We’ll consider it as 3500. Question mark item is subject on damage parts and require to be resurvey
upon inspection.

As for the mark X, it is not given or not approve. The rest mark tick is given or approved parts.

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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Mica Alyssa Rafidah
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