Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Winson Tan <winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 12:20 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SMQ 2320U-DOA: 20/2/2021

Hi veron. | confirmed accept and agree with the finalized amount for SMQ 2320U.
Thank you

Best regards
Winson tan

Get Outlook for Android

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 9:32:46 AM

To: Winson_tingwei@hotmail.com <Winson_tingwei@hotmail.com>
Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: SMQ 2320U-DOA: 20/2/2021

Dear Winson,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $4350 @ 4 days

Please check and confirmed

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



