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COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD ||

REPAIR ESTIMATE
Vehicle No. : SHC1041P / Date- 15.10 2071

Make :HYUNDAI _ ERB0 (!»m
Model nsuranca

:IONIQ |
N — MVA MS LOKE YY

L |
|
|

St

JFRT - i o 459 e i Al rlppiod ] e 7 )
DOOR MIRROR ASSY A4 LH. $1.301 ‘7}%{(1
SUB TOTAL $1,391.70
LESS 25% 534793
DISCOUNTED TOTAL| $1,042.78
Labour Charge
PANEL BEATING 5150,09/
SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE $150.00
WIRING CHARGE $30.00
\J
TOTAL LABOUR| $330.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL| $1,373.78
This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the above vehicle. The final repair quantum will be
prepared after the vehicle is surveyed by a motor Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.

T
U @ ( fthous - (o
2275%6
<Z 5 % D( LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
the Repairer of the following:
l %’ lo (2 ( ’ 6 l S « To resurvey beforelafter spray painting
Z « To display damaged pari(s) during resurvey
g‘ « Parts prices are subject o confirmation
/ q'ﬂ J{r '{{7 o v { 7 h o> « Third party survey is on a “Without Prejudice’ basls
o No lllegal modification(s) is allowed
« Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
‘ ‘ c[ﬂ (3 S wP is subject to final approval from Insurance Company
Asknowlzdged by Repairer
-




> Back to OneMotoering

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner 1D Type
Company
TR 821R
Vehicle Details
Vehecle No SHC1041P
Vehicle to be Exported No
Intended Deregistration Date, 270ct 2021
Vehicle Make HYUNDAI
Vehicle Model: AE IONIQHEV 1.6 DCT
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year. 2018
Engine No. G4LEJU0B0636
Chassis No. KMHCB851CVKU107386
Maximum Power Output: 103.6 kW (138 bhp)
Open Market Value: $24,785.00
Original Registration Date: 03Sep2018
First Registration Date: 03 Sep 2018
Transfer Count: 0
Actual ARF Paid: $11,699.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 02 Sep 2026
PARF Rebate Amount: $8,774.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 02 Sep 2026
COE Category: A-Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 8
POP Paid: $25,872.00
COE Rebate Amount: $15,683,00
Total Rebate Amount: $24,457.00
Message
Please note that the 8-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever Is earlier,
The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Oct 2021
OK
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- Loke Wes Yenq - Orithewn

RE: DOA 15.10.2021 SHC1041p wi
: 1P wi i
CDMCG21001569-001 th yourinsured GBKs835¢ ERGO Claim:

(e}

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd i
ot (Claims Oepartment) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

CAUTION : This email onginated fr

Om an external part
open attachment unless you know ’

the sender,

Dear LKK,

Please conduct this survey request.
(Note: Survey vehicle only, LOD will be handled by Ergo)

Kindly inform us if YOu are not able to attend it.
Thank you.

Data Classification: Confidential, €3

Warmest Regards,
Zheng HanYang
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

B Temasek Boulevard, £04-01 Suntec Tower Three
Singapore 038988

DID.: +65 6829 9176
hany@gzheng@ggo.com.sg

ERGO

A Munich Re compoany

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe. Worldwide, ERGO is represented in more than 30 countries and
concentrates on Eurcpe and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers.

Disclaimer: This message and its attachments are confidential, intended only for the named addressee, and may be privileged. If you are nat the intended
recipient, you should not disclose, distribute, copy or use this communication. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender by return email and
delete this message. By opening any attachment to this message, you agree to accept the risk that it may contain a virus or damaging code, and you agree

that ERGO Insurance Pte Ltd. will not be liable for any loss or damage (hereby caused

From: Loke Wei Yieng <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com>
Sent: Monday, 18 October 2021 8:12 am

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Cc: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: Re: DOA 15.10.2021 SHC1041P with your insured GBK5838K

Hi Sir,

i j i mZmk%3D 1/5
https://outlook.office.com/mailfinbox/id/AAQkADdINWZIYzI5L TgON TctNGMzMy 1hNjBhLThkNjdIYmEyZjY 2ZZQAQAONBgDr8skAhr 1w4RNtmZm



10/18/21, 2:26 PM

Mail - Loke Wei Yieng - Outlook

Pls appoint LKK to conduct survey.

Thanks & regards,

Ms. Loke YY
Loyang Accident Repair

ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
DID: 62148355

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

(Claims Department) An_mwsmmﬁ.ﬁo.no?mmv
Sent: Sunday, 17 October 20216:47 PM

To: Loke Wei Yieng <LokeWY@sparkcarcare.com>
Cc: Jumani Bin Masudin <jumanibm@cdge.com.sg>
Subject: FW: DOA 15.10.2021 SHC1041P with your insured GBK5838K

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or
open attachment unless you know the sender.

Dear Sir/Mdm

We would like to conduct a PRI survey, please refer to our list of surveyors :

Survey Company Surveyor Name
Priority Services Jeffrey Ong
AJAX Billy
Autoprobe Tay Beng Hee
Perfect Automobile Gary Chuah
AlS Looi
FTA Gary Soon
IAS Edward
JPK Anthony J
LKK Byran ]

Data Classification: Confidential, C3

Warmest Regards,
Zheng HanYang
ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.

8 Temasek Boulevard, #04-01 Suntec Tower Three
Singapore 038988

DID.: +65 6829 9176
hanyang.zheng@ergo.com.sg

i j i KAhr1W4RNtMZmk%30D  2/5
hitps://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKADINWZIYzISLTgONTCtNGMzMy 1 hNjBhLThkNjdIYmEyZjY 2ZQAQAONBgDr8s|
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ENTRY DATE & TIME 151072021 17:41 (SGT)
SUBRMITTED BY. Buna

VERSION 1 (15102021 17:41 (SGT))

Q SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please repon coedlly the details of the acadent 1o speed up the claims process.

2 Thit Form mus! be completed by the Palicyhalder and/or the Autharised Diiver

3. Information provided must be as trulhiul and accurate as possible. Any willul misrepresentation or witholding of material facis may allow insurance campanies lo repudiate

palicy kiability
4 The issue and a
faise ra

™ by Insurance companies Is not an admission of policy liability on the pant of the Insurance companies.

ecords Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapare (GIA) for archiving

and that coples of this report will, for 3 fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.
7. By the lodgement of this report 1o the insurers, you hereby consent 10 the archiving of this report al the cenlre and lo copies of the report being made available aforesaid

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date of Submission

Date of Accident

Exact Location of Accident
Additional Location Information
Country/State of Loss

15/10/2021 17:41 (SGT)
15/10/2021 13:25 (SGT)
Loyang Way, Singapore

Singapore

ILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Vehicle Registration Number
INSURED/POLICYHOLDER

Is company?

Name Of Registered Owner
Company Reg No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No
Alternative Phone No

VEHICLE PARTICULARS

Manufacturer

Model

Variant

Exact purpose for which vehicle was being used at time of

accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy for repair to
your vehicle?

Vehicle Category

Transmission

cC

INSURANCE COMPANY

Name of Insurance Company
Type of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

DRIVER

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Qb,nnam_.z report SJ0421AF000K

SHC1041P

Yes

COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD
1XXXXX821R
fleetsafety@cdgtaxi.com.sg

(Phone) +65-90622270

(Office) +65-65508768

Hyundai
Ae ioniq

Private hire

No - Claiming third party
Taxi
Auto
1580

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd
ThirdPartyFireTheft
Yes

VFX/P2419138

CHOO LAM KOON
SXXXX954F

Page 10of 18



Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Oriving experience

Gender

Mobife Number

Alt. Phone Number

Emall Address

Address

Address complement

Postcode

Is the driver the policyholder?

I No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Does Driver Own Other Vehicles?

Vehicle Registration Number of Other Vehicle Owned by Driver

Insurance Company of Other Vehicle Owned by Driver
GENERAL INFORMATION OF THE ACCIDENT

Type of Accident
Weather Conditions
Road Surface

OTHER INFORMATION

Was any foreign vehicle involved in the accident?
Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was anybody injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by ambulance?
Was any other vehicle or property damaged?

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)

Has the driver been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance?

DETAILS OF POLICE ACTION

Was the accident reported to the police?
Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If yes, against whom?

CIRCUMSTANCES OF ACCIDENT

ON 15/10/2021 AT ABOUT 13:25HR, | WAS DRIVING
STRAIGHT ON FIRST LANE, VEHICLE B (GBK5838K)
A LEFT SIDE MIRROR AND BACK TO H
ACCIDENT,

ATTACHMENT(S)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Reasons for not uploading a video of the accident
Was there any audio recorded?

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Manufacturer
Vehicle Model

Vehicle Variant

Vehicle Colour

Vehicle Category

Name of Driver

Q.>nnam2 report SJ0421AF000K

LS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

2410/1966
Outdoor
190012006

15 YEARS AND 1 MONTH
Male

(Phone) +65-90622270

__S_mu§<®8nax_,83.we
50 BUKIT BATOK STREET 31 #09-01

659442
No

Hirer
No

Collision - Changefcross lane
Clear

Dry

No
No

Yes

No

No
No

VEHICLE A (SHC1041P) ALONG LOYANG WAY. WHILE TRAVELLING
WHICH WAS ON SECOND LANE, CUT INTO MY LANE HIT ONTO VEHICLE
IS LANE. EXCHANGED PARTICULARS. NOBODY WAS INJURED AT THE TIME OF THE

Yes
Yes
FILE IS NOT SUITABLE

No

GBK5838K

Commercial vehicle

Page 2 of 18




Contact Number (Phone) +65-84280228
Address =
Address complement o
Postcode L
Insurance Company Name -
Nature Of Damage -
Details of property damaged in accident .
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver) 1

f18
gﬁ\coéenl report SJ0421AF000K Page 30
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SKETCH PLAN

of the acoident to speed up the claims process,
2 Ths Form must be ! o h d r
3. Information Provided must be gs ruthful and accu as possible Any wilful misre j f material
Mu presentation or w ithholding of facts
aliow nsurance comparses 1o Cepudiate policy llability i

4 ThmwmmmFmbymwmmhmmnammdpw
companes

S. Any faise reporting may be referrod to the Police for investigation
€ The repontwaibe lomamoobyn\eineurmci the

GIA Records Management Centro established by the General Insurance Association
of Sﬂwnro(GIAHov armivmgaidlhalwpissol thi

'S ropost will for a fee be made available upan application by interested partigs.
7. By the lodgement of this report 1o the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the cantre and to copies of the
feport being made avnilable aloresaid

8 Consont under the Personal Data Pr

Cy liabilty on the part of the insuranca

otoction Act(PDPA)

() processing, handéng and/or dealing w ith my claims including the settiement of the claims and any necessary investigations reialing to
the claims:

O] imesﬁgaung the accident and/or my claims;
(=) CATying oul and/cr deafing v/ ith my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

(¢ administering my daims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, rg
disciosure of certain personal data about me Lo bring about delivery of the Same as w ell as
Packages); andior

(v} complying w ith applicable Lav in administeri
{collectvely the “Purposes”)

(b) alinsurer(s) who have insured vehicl
use. disclose and/or process my Person: bove Purpeses; and

(c) mry Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA to their third part
(including thesr law yers/law firms), w hich may be sited outside g

ports or notices to me, w hich could involve
on the external cover of envelopes/mail

ng. processing. handling and/or dealing with my claims.

e(s} involved in this arcident and the (

nsurers’ law yers/law firms, ma
3l Infermation for one or mare of the al

y/are permitted 1o collect,

Y Service providers or agents
gapore, for ene or more of the above Purposes.

e

e
Policyholders Signature / Dato & Criver's Signafure river is not the palicyholder) / Date Wlnessod by Rgperting Centre
Time T‘j/ 0 3_

& Time / / — L/ (9Y0) ’l} Personnel
Sketch Plan

V/ @‘“‘-}‘W&W

<
<t) %;%"‘\l v
$ ;) 5; V A- g oy
J

f___
)

b-Gieks 43¢ K
SRR A

Page 4 of 18
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SKETCH PLAN #2

Describe Circumstances of the Accident

ON 15/10/2021 AT ABOUT 13:25HR, | WAS DRIVING VEHICLE A
(SHC1041P) ALONG LOYANG WAY. WHILE TRAVELLING STRAIGHT ON
FIRST LANE, VEHICLE B (GBK5838K) WHICH WAS ON SECOND LANE, CUT
INTO MY LANE HIT ONTO VEHICLE A LEFT SIDE MIRROR AND BACK TO
HIS LANE. EXCHANGED PARTICULARS. NOBODY WAS INJURED AT THE

TIME OF THE ACCIDENT.

Declaration
|We declare the foregoing particulars are true In every r%

Policyholder's Signature / Date & Driver's Signat (If&h’v r is not the Wliwmﬁ Dale  Witnessed by Rpparting Centre
Ti &Ti = Personnel
~ ™ (¥ Tio [~ (Y0

Page 5 of 18
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