Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 4:31 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: (Accident Involving Vehicle GV4664) and GBH6510A (your Insured ) dated
13/10/2021

Attachments: GV4664 LETTER OF AUTHORITY jpg; GV4664 REPAIR BILL.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Cecilia
We submit our claim as follow

Repair Cost SS$ 1284.00
Loss of Used SS 240.00 ( 3days )
Total : SS 1524.00

Please let us have you offer to settle

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: jouis [mailto:jouis@jinauto.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 15 October 2021 4:35 PM

To: 'Aini Binte' <Aini@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Esther Lim' <EstherLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; 'jin@jinauto.com.sg' <jin@jinauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: (Accident Involving Vehicle GV4664) and GBH6510A (your Insured ) dated 13/10/2021

Dear Aini

Please assign to:

-LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd — 62563561
Thank you & Best Regards,

Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.



