Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 17 December 2021 19:18

To: chan pick yuen; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SMQ9442E & SGW3055T DOA 9.10.21 *** LKK REF : CC6/CTI21010595/Aea3
Attachments: Full_accident_report_8118753_11-10-2021_145319 PW_SMQ9442E5507).PDF;

INVOICE.PDF; LTA FEE.PDF; LOA.PNG; PHOTO-2021-10-12-10-20-14jpg;
PHOTO-2021-10-12-10-20-12.jpg

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris chanbebe@hotmail.com]
Sent: Friday, December 17,2021 6:08 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: SMQ9442E & SGW3055T DOA 9.10.21

Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Your refer : SGW3055T -China taiping

Our GIA report password : SMQ9442E5507)

Enclosed is our client's GIA , LOA , LTA fee & invoice .
As request following :

RC $ 8200.00 -As agreed

loss of use $1320.00 ( $120 -2800cc X 11 Days -9 Days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 days weekend -
total 11 days )

LTA $7.45

@ 100% ( direct from behind with scene photos )

Total $9527.45

Please let us have your offer & reply soon . Thanks

Best Regards

Chris Chan

SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR
HP: 92712214

Virus-free. www.avg.com



LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR

BLOCEK 2020A UBE

ROAD | #01-33

f (5441 SINGAPORE 408714 A

Dear Sir,

Accident on 0{”{‘,}{'1!@ |rlr 3553’;'}#"5

Invalving Vehicle Nos S‘m& q%L‘L?E gg— S‘G’?w}ﬁ?\ﬁ; ?_
Along CTE Serangod’?

| Wethe reglistered owner (driver of veRicle registration no:

oM e guy2 E
< hawe involved in the above aocident.

1/We hereby authorize M/S SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR to commenee repairs of the said vehich:
forthwith.

1/ agyee to assign the whole proceeds of mry/our comprehensive/third party claim o you and our
solicitors to met en my/our behalf in respect of the above
matter And if applicable,my/our solicitors shall accept this as my/our irrevocable authority to pay
the amount as deemed compensatad direct to you after deduction of their costs on a Solicitor and

client basis.

I/ undertake to co-operate fully with you and our solicitors to ensure that claim is successful.

1/We also authorize you io sign all discharge vouchers/indemnity forms and all necessary papers in
relation with the above claim in myfour absonce.

our kinri co-operation in this matter will be much appreciated.
Thank you. :

Yours, by,

{Cempany's stamp if applicable)

Name: Mo lop ¢ RaAm
N'F.‘._I'f.: Mo SISO FS

Drate:




2017

SIN FATT DIESEL MOTOR

Blk 3020A #01-33 Ubi Road 1 Singapore 408714
Business Reg.No: 377435/00K

INVOICE

NG KOK CHUAN Date: 17" DEC 21
Blk 3020A #01-33

Ubi Road 1

Singapore 408714

Accident date:09" OCT 2021
Final Bill For Vehicle No: SMQ9442E TOYOTA ALPHARD

Descriptions AMOUNT

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by $8,200.00

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Totall $8,200.00

S/ DLRS : EIGHT THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED ONLY
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Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-211011-002780
Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SGW3055T
As at 09 Oct 2021/13:45:00

Print Date/Time :

Receipt Date/Time :

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Insurance Co: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

1 Insurance Enquiry - SGW3055T
Enquiry Fee
20211011160506890293

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Sub-Total

Total Before Rounding
Rounding Difference
Total Amount Payable
Paid By
20211011160533287
Total

Cash Change
Tendered Amount

Excess Refundable Amount

Amount GST
Before Amount
GST (S%) (S9%)
7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

7.00 0.49

Direct Debit: eNETS Debit
(Internet Banking)

11 Oct 2021/ 16:06:20
11 Oct 2021/ 16:06:19

Amount
After GST
(S9)

7.49

7.49
7.49
0.04
7.45

7.45
7.45
0.00
7.45
0.00

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



