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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 14 October 2021 9:35 am

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FBJ2187E Receipts

Attachments: TapScanner 10-07-2021-15.48.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,  

 

Case finalised 

Refer to attachment for the towing receipt 

 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: JL Powersports [mailto:sales@jlpowersport.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 13 October, 2021 7:52 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: FBJ2187E Receipts 

 

Hi Sir, 

 

Apologies for the late reply.  

 

Kindly proceed. 

 

 

Thank you 

 

Best Regards 

 

Jezreel 

 

 

 

On Tue, Oct 12, 2021 at 2:57 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Jazreel, 

  

Any update? 
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Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 11 October, 2021 10:56 AM 

To: JL Powersports 
Subject: RE: FBJ2187E Receipts 

  

Hi Jazreel, 

  

Kindly assist and update 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 8 October, 2021 10:01 AM 
To: JL Powersports 
Subject: RE: FBJ2187E Receipts 

  

Hi Jazreel, 

  

Refer to attachment 

Part prices check slightly high, necessary adjustment has to made 

Finalised amount is $ 700 / 3 days of lump sum repair 

Kindly confirm and revert back to confirm 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: JL Powersports [mailto:sales@jlpowersport.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 7 October, 2021 3:53 PM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: FBJ2187E Receipts 
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Dear Sir, 

  

Kindly find attached for your reference. 

  

Thank you 

  

Best Regards 

  

Jezreel 

  

On Wed, Oct 6, 2021 at 2:46 PM JL Powersports <sales@jlpowersport.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

  

Kindly find attached for your reference 

  

Thank you 

  

Best regards 

Jezreel 

97760325 

 

1 Soon Lee Street 

#05-53 

Pioneer Centre 

Singapore 627605 
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Co. Reg: 53388685J 

 

 

  

--  

 

1 Soon Lee Street 

#05-53 

Pioneer Centre 

Singapore 627605 

Co. Reg: 53388685J 

 

 

 

--  

 
1 Soon Lee Street 

#05-53 

Pioneer Centre 

Singapore 627605 

Co. Reg: 53388685J 


