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Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 21 October 2021 8:08 AM
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto); Stephanie Loke; Yvonne Chew; Eva Kok Wai Kee; Tan Wei Cin; 

Ronald Yap; Jobi Thomas; Jess Francis Carlos; Eric Paul Glorioso
Subject: RE: SMZ 4388P - Repair Limit

Morning Steve, 
 
We’ll undertake the repair limit @ $ 48,000.00 before GST for the above mentioned, thanks. 
 
Best Regards. 
 
Derek Oh 
Insurance Claims Executive 
27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042 
T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0684 F: (65) 6331 0690 
E: derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg W: www.eurokarsgroup.com 

 
 
 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 20 October 2021 9:29 PM 
To: Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SMZ 4388P - Repair Limit 
 

Hi Derek, 
 
As per agreed that the above vehicle $48k repair limit. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

 You don't often get email from stevechen@lkkauto.com. Learn why this is important  
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Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) 
Sent: Friday, 15 October 2021 9:04 pm 
To: Derek Oh <derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg> 
Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SMZ 4388P - Repair Limit  
  
Hi Derek, 
 
Kindly inform that the above vehicle repair limit is $45K. 
 
Kindly let us know undertake the repair. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 


