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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 9 December 2021 2:43 PM
To: Alfred Quah
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC7075T AND SJV6766A ON 10/10/2021 15.00 ( SGT ) 

at 25 Li Hwan Close
Attachments: DV_SMC7075T.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mr Alfred, 
 
As spoken earlier, we confirm settlement at a global sum of $7,300.00(all-in). 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: Alfred Quah <alfredautoss@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 8 December 2021 4:26 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC7075T AND SJV6766A ON 10/10/2021 15.00 ( SGT ) at 25 Li Hwan Close 
 
 
 
[WITHOUT PREJUDICE SAVE AS TO COSTS] 
 
Dear Sirs / Hsiao Tong  ( LKK Auto ) 
 
We would like to propose a global settlement at 7,500.00 on a goodwill basis.  
 
Our client is driving a 2000 cc car and we have Waived our cost and report for a quick and amazing settlement .  
 
Please confirm  
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. 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
 
Alfred QUAH (Mr) 
Alfred Auto Services & Supplies 
ACRA: 391089/00E 
HP/WhatsApp: 9145-4773 
Tel: 6483-4586 
Fax: 6483-4882 
Email: alfredautoss@gmail.com 
Address: 5035 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2, #01-351,  
Singapore 569538 
 
 
On Wed, Dec 8, 2021 at 3:56 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Mr Alfred, 

  

We refer to the above matter, 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $7,100.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 4:31 PM 
To: Alfred Quah <alfredautoss@gmail.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC7075T AND SJV6766A ON 10/10/2021 15.00 ( SGT ) at 25 Li Hwan Close  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

We refer to your below email. 

  

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under 
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above-mentioned 
case. 

  

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to 
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the 
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the 
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal. 

  

Thank you. 
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“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: Alfred Quah <alfredautoss@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 12 October 2021 7:40 PM 
To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <aigsgp_claimssurvey@aig.com> 
Subject: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD ( TP CLAIM ) 

  

AIG BUILDING                                                         

78 SHENTON WAY # 09-16 Singapore 079120  

Motor Claim Department                                     ( URGENT ) 

 
 

[WITHOUT PREJUDICE SAVE AS TO COSTS] 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMC7075T AND SJV6766A  ON 10/10/2021 15.00 ( SGT ) at 25 Li Hwan Close  

  

DEAR SIRS 
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We act for GLEN MORGAN D COSTA whose vehicle SMC7075T Was damage in the above accident as a result of the 
accident our clients vehicle was damaged before our client proceeded to repair the damaged vehicle please let us 
know within 2 working days of your receipt of this notice whether you like to conduct a ( PRE -REPAIR SURVEY )  

Our client vehicle is at the following address.  

  

GOH LEE HWA AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD  

BLK 5033 ANG MO KIO IND PK2 # 01-255 

Singapore 569536 

  

PERSON IN CHARGE Alfred Quah @ 91454773  

  

IN COMPLIANCE WITH THE NIMA PROTOCOL PLEASE LET US HAVE YOUR 10 SURVEYORS  

IF WE DO NOT RECEIVE ANY REPLY FROM YOU WITHIN THE STIPULATED TIME LINE OUR CLIENT SHALL PROCEED TO 
REPAIR THE VEHICLE WITHOUT FURTHER REFERENCE TO YOU . 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

  

  

Alfred QUAH (Mr) 

HP/WhatsApp: 9145-4773 

Tel: 6483-4586 

Fax: 6483-4882 

Email: alfredautoss@gmail.com 


