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Claim Audit

=l AUDIT TRAIL

07 Oct Clm Veh

1 2021 Model (203425) VOLKSWAGEN GOLF 1.4 TSI (A7) (5G13GZ) (A). éﬁ}\:ggﬂ::‘aan
15:19 Changed
5 ggzold Clm Reg No: SKZ4041M. Acct Date: 2021/10/05. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: India International Insurance Pte  [R] Monitha
15:19 Created Ltd (HQ). Workshop: Mova Automotive Pte Ltd (Bukit Merah) Gunasekaran
07 Oct .
Cim [R] Monitha
3 2021 Submitted 1481.70. Gunasekaran
15:29
07 Oct = .
Adj Co . [I] Krishnan
4 igzllg Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): Bhuvaneswari
07 Oct Adj Next )
5 2021 Rpt Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/10/18 B[;i'NKarr'fehS’;fa”ri
17:19 Changed
07 Oct Adj )
6 2021 Mandate Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. B[hI] Krlshnan_
uvaneswari
17:19 Set
07 Oct Assignment [A] HOW MEI
7 2021 1st KWAN
21:04 Accessed
07 Oct
Label . [A] HOW MEI
8 20.21 Added (30653):Direct Settlement. KWAN
21:10
07 Oct Adj
9 2021 Adjuster [None] -> CHEN TSUE YEE (Al EV?IXVNMEI

21:10 Assigned
08 Oct Adj Next Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/10/18. Mandate Remarks: Dear Sir, please refer to Insured accident r [I] Derrick

10 2021 Rpt eport which states that TP side swiped OI. please request video from TP to prove otherwise, if not we wil  Tan Ming
09:28 Changed | just dent this claim. Thank you. Chye
08 Oct Adj A d:0.00:Dear Sir, pl fer to Insured accident report which states that TP side swiped OI. ple L1 Derrick
11 2021 Mandate pproved:0.00:Dear Sir, please refer to Insured accident report which states tha side swipe Pl "o Ming
ase request video from TP to prove otherwise, if not we will just dent this claim. Thank you.
09:28 Set Chye
08 Oct ¢y pu [A] HOW MET
12 2021 i Insured Name: UNKNOWN -> INFINITY COACH & TRADING PTE LTD. Insured ID: 0 -> 201321968C.
13:17 Modified KWAN
13 ggzcid ag{ Next Cur Rpt:Final Rpt. Cur Due Date:2021/10/18. Mandate Remarks: Dear Sir, please refer to video footage [}I']ar?(lfllr}::(g:;k
17:38 Changed from insured. we are denying liability for this matter. Thank you. Chye
08 Oct Adj Approved:0.00:Dear Sir, please refer to video footage from insured. we are denying liability for this matt t Der_rlck
14 2021 Mandate er. Thank vou Tan Ming
17:38 Set ' you. Chye
Date From 4|7E | pate To 4|7 [ »| Audit Type  None v
ACTIVITY
No record
Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History
Mova Mova
07 Oct 2021 OD/TP Case . Automotive
2731449 15:19:49 (Repairer) Motor Automotive Pte Ltd (Bukit SKZ4041M XX.XX
Pte Ltd
Merah)
07 Oct 2021 TPC Mova Int Indlt? [
2731524 ¢ ase Motor Automotive nternationa SKZ4041M XX. XX
17:19:44 (Insurer) Pte Ltd Insurance Pte
Ltd (HQ)
India India
08 Oct 2021 ) International | International Derrick Tan
2731776 17:37:40 Video Upload Motor Insurance Pte | Insurance Pte SKZ4041M Ming Chye XXX
Ltd (HQ) Ltd (HQ)
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10/12/21, 5:20 PM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Re: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/20271 ***
LKK REF: CC4/11121010355/ra3

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Mon 10/11/2021 10:41 AM
To: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jacelyn' <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>; ‘Motor Claim - llI' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; 'Derrick Tan' <DerrickTan@iii.com.sg>;
Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter

We have our insured's video showing that our insured was within his own lane when the accident
happen.

In view of the above, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability
and unable to look into your client’s matter

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, October 8, 2021 12:32 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jacelyn' <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>; 'Motor Claim - lII' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; 'Derrick Tan'
<DerrickTan@iii.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021 *** LKK REF:
CC4/1121010355/ra3

Dear Hsiao Tong,

My client does not have any video footage as evidence and as per my client PC5158R driver mention got video
footage,
May | have the video footage.

Thank you,
Best Regards,

Nutha
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314
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@MOVA ¢ o

Automolive Ple Ltd

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 8 October 2021 12:03 PM

To: Nitha

Cc: 'Jacelyn'; 'Motor Claim - III'; 'Derrick Tan'; Admin A; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021 *** LKK REF:
CC4/11121010355/ra3

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that liability is unclear. Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy
reference.

We would like to request for evidence (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary action.
Appreciate an early reply.
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 October 2021 10:45 am

To: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jacelyn' <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>; 'Motor Claim - lII' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>; 'Derrick Tan'
<DerrickTan@iii.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021 *** LKK REF:
CC4/11121010355/ra3

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler, Jaslin will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
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10/12/21, 5:20 PM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

Hi HT,
Kindly assist in absence of Jaslin.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Nitha [mailto:nitha@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, October 8, 2021 9:20 AM

To: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com>; 'Derrick Tan' <DerrickTan@iii.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jacelyn' <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>; 'Motor Claim - llI' <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021

Dear All,
Kindly please advise on the liability.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Nitha

Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA o o

Automolive Ple Ltd

From: Motor Claim - III [mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 5:17 PM

To: Nitha; 'SUR'; Admin A; 'Summer (LKK Auto)'

Cc: 'Jacelyn'; Derrick Tan

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021

Dear Sir/ Mdm,
Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SKZ4041M and let us have your report urgently.

This claim will be handled by Mr Derrick.
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*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

Bhuvaneswari

Motor & Work Injury Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street #04-02 |OB Building

Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 231 Fax: 6224 4174

W InDia

o
& — Y [ nTERNATIONAL
y 'J,"f' Insuramce
L E1l M GAPFORIE

Ravving the region riacs 1857

From: Nitha <nitha@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 4:51 pm

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jacelyn' <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021

Dear All,
Kindly assign LKK.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Ndtha

Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA o o

Automolive Ple Ltd

From: Motor Claim - III [mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sq]

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 4:24 PM

To: Nitha

Cc: Jacelyn'

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021

Dear Sir / Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We propose using one of the following motor surveyors:
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e Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd
e Autoprobe Consultants

e VP Appraisal

e Form Team Adjusters Pte Ltd

e JP Knights Adjusters

e LBS Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e Priority Services

e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to
the above list.

Bhuvaneswari

Motor & Work Injury Claims Department
India International Insurance Pte Ltd

64 Cecil Street #04-02 10B Building

Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100 Ext 231 Fax: 6224 4174

W lnpia
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From: Nitha <pitha@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 3:49 pm

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: 'Jacelyn' <jacelyn@mova.com.sg>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] - TP CLAIMS - SKZ4041M AGAINST PC5158R DOA 05/10/2021

Dear All,
Kindly assign surveyor and revert liability for the above mention case.

Thank you,
Best Regards,
Ndtha
Claims Officer

Mova Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314

@MOVA o o

Automolive Ple Ltd

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain
confidential and/or legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was
intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of
the error and also be hereby notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or
dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability for any
errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result
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of Internet transmission or any modification. If you have sent or are sending personal data, you
undertake that the personal data being sent is current, complete and accurate. You understand and
consent that the personal data may be processed and retained by India International Insurance Pte Ltd
(“IIT) in line with the purposes in III’s Personal Data Policy (https://www.iii.com.sg/privacy-policy).
For third party’s personal data, you undertake that you have obtained the consent from the third party
and made the party aware of all matters listed in this policy by referring them to III’s website. This
message may contain confidential information intended only for the individual named. If you are not
the named addressee, do not disseminate, distribute or copy this email. Please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email from your system. Any views expressed in the email are those of
the individual sender, except where the sender specifically states them to be the view of III. The
information and/or comments provided or expressed in this message are not to be construed as legal
advice and are not intended to replace legal advice. You should not rely on any information and/or
comments provided or expressed in this message/research memorandum as legal advice. III shall not
be responsible for any loss or damage arising from your reliance on any information and/or comments
provided or expressed in this message.”

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed. It may contain
confidential and/or legally privileged information. If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was
intended, or if this e-mail has reached you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of
the error and also be hereby notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or
dissemination of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be
unlawful. Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses. Therefore, we do not accept liability for any
errors or omissions in the content of this message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result
of Internet transmission or any modification. If you have sent or are sending personal data, you
undertake that the personal data being sent is current, complete and accurate. You understand and
consent that the personal data may be processed and retained by India International Insurance Pte Ltd
(“IIT”) in line with the purposes in III’s Personal Data Policy (https://www.iii.com.sg/privacy-policy).
For third party’s personal data, you undertake that you have obtained the consent from the third party
and made the party aware of all matters listed in this policy by referring them to III’s website. This
message may contain confidential information intended only for the individual named. If you are not
the named addressee, do not disseminate, distribute or copy this email. Please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email from your system. Any views expressed in the email are those of
the individual sender, except where the sender specifically states them to be the view of I11. The
information and/or comments provided or expressed in this message are not to be construed as legal
advice and are not intended to replace legal advice. You should not rely on any information and/or
comments provided or expressed in this message/research memorandum as legal advice. I1I shall not
be responsible for any loss or damage arising from your reliance on any information and/or comments
provided or expressed in this message.”
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