Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Exclusive Enterprise <exclusiveenterprise50@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 29 November 2021 2:44 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SMV 5820Y - LOD

Hi Cecilia,
Bank

UOB Current
3413130407

Paynow
UEN 201906614W
Exclusive Enterprise Pte Ltd

Reference please input our client vehicle number.

Kindly provide receipt or screenshot of payment made.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

XIANG

Exclusive Enterprise Pte Ltd
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #03-49
PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT

Singapore 415875

Tel: 8878 5573 Fax: 6242 6370

On Mon, 29 Nov 2021 at 14:28, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly provide the bank/cheque details for our insured to perform the payment.
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