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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Jaclyn Loh <jaclyn.loh@grab.com>
Sent: Friday, 26 November 2021 4:52 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Stina Chen; Celyn Lim
Subject: Re: [External] ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMW 3049R & SMV 5820Y ON 25/09/2021

Dear Cecilia 
 
Please proceed with the mandate at $ 1,237.45 
 
Thank 
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Jaclyn Loh   /  Associate - Insurance & Claims jaclyn.loh@grab.com/  +65 87002138 
Grab3 Media Close #07-03Singapore 138498https://www.grab.com 
 

 
 
On Fri, Nov 26, 2021 at 4:06 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We refer to the above matter. 
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We understand Grab is willing to do private settlement for settlement below $2,000.00+/-. LOD and final estimate 
attached for your easy reference, no injury involved. 

We propose to offer TP workshop as below :  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST)  $ 1,050.00  

2. Loss of Use (3 days x $60.00)  $    180.00  

3.LTA Search Fee  $        7.45  
Total  $ 1,237.45  

  

Kindly have your approval on proposal above.  We will proceed to negotiate with TP workshop for a lower settlement 
amount upon approval.. 

  

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will 

be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

 
 
By communicating with Grab Inc and/or its subsidiaries, associate companies and jointly controlled entities (“Grab Group”), you are deemed to have consented to 
the processing of your personal data as set out in the Privacy Notice which can be viewed at https://grab.com/privacy/ 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Exclusive Enterprise <exclusiveenterprise50@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 29 November 2021 2:44 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: SMV 5820Y - LOD

Hi Cecilia , 
 
Bank 
UOB Current 
3413130407 
 
Paynow 
UEN 201906614W 
Exclusive Enterprise Pte Ltd 
 
Reference please input our client vehicle number. 
 
Kindly provide receipt or screenshot of payment made. 
 
 
Thanks. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
XIANG 
Exclusive Enterprise Pte Ltd 
8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4 #03-49 
PREMIER@KAKI BUKIT 
Singapore 415875 
Tel: 8878 5573  Fax: 6242 6370 
 

 
 
On Mon, 29 Nov 2021 at 14:28, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

Kindly provide the bank/cheque details for our insured to perform the payment. 


