Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for your acceptance.

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 28 April 2022 10:21 AM

Selena Tan Lee See (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd)

Admin A

RE: Accident Involving YP 1471L (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHC 4657T (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/QBE21010320/R1rs3) - Our Ref: TAX/10/21/2002/ST)

DV_SHC4657T.pdf; ATA_SHC4657T.pdf

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Selena Tan Lee See (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Selena.Tan@strides.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 1:56 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving YP 1471L (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHC 4657T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/QBE21010320/R1rs3) -

Our Ref: TAX/10/21/2002/ST)

Dear Hsiao Tong

We confirm acceptance of your offer for $2450.00 for our property claims.

Please let us have your DV in favour of Strides Taxi Pte Ltd

Thank you




Regards

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct line +65 6866 2653 | Direct fax +65 6368 7421
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705

STRIDES

AUTOMDODTIVE

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 27 April 2022 8:16 am

To: Selena Tan Lee See (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Selena.Tan@strides.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident Involving YP 1471L (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHC 4657T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/QBE21010320/R1rs3) -
Our Ref: TAX/1021/2002/ST)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender
and are expecting the content or attachment.

Without Prejudice

Dear Selena,

We refer to the above matter.

We are prepared to improve our offer at a global sum of $2,450.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Selena Tan Lee See (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Selena.Tan@strides.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 15 February 2022 10:27 AM




To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident Involving YP 1471L (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHC 4657T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/QBE21010320/R1rs3) -
Our Ref: TAX/1021/2002/ST)

Dear Jaslin

We are unable accept your offer as accident happened on a weekend. Can you add another 2 days so that we can
close the matter?

Thank you

Regards

Selona Jan

Claims and Insurance Agency

Direct line +65 6866 2653 | Direct fax +65 6368 7421
60 Woodlands Industrial Park E4

Singapore 757705

STRIDES

AUTOMDODTIVE

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 February 2022 4:48 pm

To: Selena Tan Lee See (Strides Automotive Services Pte Ltd) <Selena.Tan@strides.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Accident Involving YP 1471L (Ol : QBE - TBA) AND SHC 4657T (TP : LKK REF - CC3/QBE21010320/R1rs3)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of SMRT. Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender
and are expecting the content or attachment.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,800.00

2. Loss of Rental (9 days x $66.00) $594.00

3. LTA Search Fee $7.00
Total | $2,401.00

Please confirm acceptance.
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



