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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 10 November 2021 4:33 PM

To: Juliana .; Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; Admin AP Automotive Services; Paul Ho; chrystia@apautomotive.services; 

info@apautosg.com; marcus@apautosg.com

Subject: Fw: FINAL BILL & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS FOR GBH 9209R & YOUR REF: 

SNM21D205601 on 01.10.2021 LKK REF : CS/CTI21010318/R1vy3

Attachments: LOD GBH 9209R.pdf

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir / Madam,  

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course. 

 

Hi Veron, 

 

FYNA, CS/CTI21010318/R1vy3 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

  

  

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 

of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
                                                               

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Su Li| Admin Support 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
 

From: Juliana . <juliana@apautomotive.services> 

Sent: Wednesday, November 10, 2021 4:30 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin AP Automotive Services <mota@apautomotive.services>; Paul Ho <paul@apautomotive.services>; Chrystia 

Liew <chrystia@apautomotive.services>; info <info@apautosg.com>; Marcus Teo <marcus@apautosg.com> 

Subject: FINAL BILL & SUPPORTING DOCUMENTS FOR GBH 9209R & YOUR REF: SNM21D205601 on 01.10.2021  
  
Dear Sir/Madam,          "WITHOUT PREJUDICE" 
  
Enclosed the final bill and relevant documents for your attention. 
  
Kindly refer to attachment and revert back to us the soonest. 
Breakdown as below: 
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Cost of Repair    : S$ 4,708.00 
Loss of Rental     : S$ 1,797.60 (14 days x $120.00 - with GST) 
Towing Charges  : S$     100.00 
LTA Search         :  S$        7.45 
Total                   :   S$ 6,613.05 
If acceptable, kindly forward your discharge voucher to us to enable our client to complete and sign. 
We appreciate your early reply 
Please do not hesitate to contact me should you have any queries thereof. 
 
Best Regards, 

Ms Juliana  
AP Automotive Services Pte Ltd 
(CLAIMS DEPARTMENT) 
ROC / GST REG NO : 202022890H 
9006 Tampines Street 93 #01-202 Tampines Industrial Park A 
Singapore 528840 
TEL : 6970 4786 
FAX : 6787 4886 


