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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 August 2022 1:46 PM

To: Management Assist; SUR

Subject: RE: FBE6989H-DOA: 18/9/2021

Dear Ray, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

As spoken. 

 

Closed at Lump Sum $1900 @ 4 days 

 

Kindly send LOD to MSIG OIC  , douglas_ong@sg.msig-asia.com 
 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Management Assist <management@assist.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 26 August 2022 12:36 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FBE6989H-DOA: 18/9/2021 

 

Hi Veron, 

 

Can we do $2100 COR and 4 days LOU. 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 
Ray T 
Accident Assist SG 
24 Sin Ming Lane 

#01-94 Midview City 
Singapore 573930 
ROC: 53375754 

Tel: 63341182  
Fax: 63341582 

 

 

On Tue, 23 Aug 2022 at 08:11, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Ray, 
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WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Lump Sum $1900 @ 4 days. 

  

Kindly confirmed. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Management Assist <management@assist.com.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 26 July 2022 1:34 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FBE6989H 

  

Hi Veron, 

  

Can we have an update on this motorcycle FBE6989H. 

  

It has been a while and we would like an update. 

  

Thank you. 
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Regards, 

Ray 

 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Ray T 

Accident Assist SG 

24 Sin Ming Lane 

#01-94 Midview City 

Singapore 573930 

ROC: 53375754 

Tel: 63341182  

Fax: 63341582 

  

  

On Fri, 18 Feb 2022 at 17:06, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Ray, 

  

Please call me 

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Management Assist <management@assist.com.sg>  

Sent: Friday, 18 February 2022 4:50 PM 

To: Claims Assist <claims@assist.com.sg>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: FBE6989H 

  

FBE6989H 

Dear Mr Lim, 

  

Just wondering if you have any reply from MSIG. 

 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Ray T 

Accident Assist SG 

24 Sin Ming Lane 

#01-94 Midview City 

Singapore 573930 

ROC: 53375754 

Tel: 63341182  

Fax: 63341582 

  

  

On Thu, 21 Oct 2021 at 16:32, TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Ray, 
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Recommended COR have to wait for mandate from insurance company, may not be the COR offered because 

msig will decide on the mandate. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Management Assist [mailto:management@assist.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 21 October, 2021 4:10 PM 

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) 
Subject: FBE6989H 

  

Here are the before repair photos of the above bike. 

 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Ray T 

Accident Assist SG 

24 Sin Ming Lane 

#01-94 Midview City 

Singapore 573930 

ROC: 53375754 

Tel: 63341182  

Fax: 63341582 


