Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 September 2022 6:49 PM

To: '‘ppemclaims@gmail.com’

Cc: 'Jessie'; edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg; carrin@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
siti@panpacificleasing.com.sg; Admin A

Subject: RE: GBH977R _ TP CLAIM - DOA 23.09.2021 - LOD

Attachments: DV_GBH 977R.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We confirm settlement at $4,541.50(all-in) as per you LOD.

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 15 August 2022 12:45 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jessie' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; edmund@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
carrin@panpacificleasing.com.sg; siti@panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: RE: GBH977R _ TP CLAIM - DOA 23.09.2021 - LOD

Dear Hsiao Tong
Kindly find attached file for LOD, Repair Invoice, TP search fee & LOA
Kindly send us the DV soonest

Thanks



Regards,

Siti Nursufrina

Accident Claims Admin

Tel: +65 8808 9240

Email: siti@panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
37 Loyang Way,Singapore 508734

* As of 1 May 2020, For all Accident Claims related matters, Please email to ppemclaims@gmail.com

Kindly note that in accordance with the latest measures introduced by the Government to curb the
spread of the Covid-19 virus, our response may be delayed. seek your understanding on the same.

NOTE : WE HAVE RELOCATED TO : 37 LOYANG WAY 5(508734)

Kindly forward all corresponding to this address with immediate effect.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 June 2022 3:55 pm

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: 'Jessie' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH977R _ TP CLAIM - DOA 23.09.2021 - Finalize

3 REMINDER
Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)




From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 5:39 PM

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: 'Jessie' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH977R _ TP CLAIM - DOA 23.09.2021 - Finalize

2" REMINDER
Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 April 2022 11:21 AM

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: 'Jessie' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH977R _ TP CLAIM - DOA 23.09.2021 - Finalize

REMINDER
Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 March 2022 10:44 AM

To: ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: 'Jessie' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBH977R _ TP CLAIM - DOA 23.09.2021 - Finalize

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental receipt) to
us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)




