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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 March 2022 9:09 AM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization

  

From: VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg> 

Sent: Thursday, 10 March 2022 9:08:37 am (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

Good morning, 
 
Pleas proceed 
 
Thanks! 
Best Regards 
Raymond Teo 
 

 
Sin Ming AutoCity 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

Singapore 575722 

Showroom/Office: #03-03 

Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 

Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 
Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

 

 

On Mon, 7 Mar 2022 at 09:52, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Raymond, 
  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $3,850.00/- with 6 days of repair, 

subject to their approval 

Kindly acknowledge 
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Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessarySave the Earth. Print only when necessary.... 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 2 March, 2022 2:58 PM 

To: VAuG Claims 

Subject: RE: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  

Hi Raymond, 

  

Kindly update 

  

  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 2 March, 2022 9:22 AM 

To: VAuG Claims 

Subject: RE: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  
Hi Raymond, 

  

Kindly acknowledge 
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Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 1 March, 2022 11:25 AM 

To: VAuG Claims 

Subject: RE: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  

Hi Raymond, 
  

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of L/S $3,850.00/- with 6 days of repair, 

subject to their approval 
  

  

  

  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: VAuG Claims [mailto:claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg]  

Sent: Tuesday, 1 March, 2022 9:55 AM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  
Good morning, 

  

We confirm the list price is $1775 for the rear RH door 

  

1 pc Rear RH door $1775 (Part no. 77004-F2000) 

  

Please revise your finalization figure 

  

Thanks! 

Best Regards 

Raymond Teo 

 
Sin Ming AutoCity 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
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Singapore 575722 
Showroom/Office: #03-03 
Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 
Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 

Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 
** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

  
  
On Mon, 29 Nov 2021 at 09:57, VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg> wrote: 

Good morning, 

  

Hold for a while 

  

We are confirming the prices 

  

Thanks! 

Best Regards 

Raymond Teo 

 
Sin Ming AutoCity 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
Singapore 575722 
Showroom/Office: #03-03 
Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 
Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 

Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
  
Follow us on :  

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

The linked 
image cannot 
be d isplayed.  
The file may  
have been 
mov ed, 
renamed, or  
deleted. 

Verify that  
the link 
points to the  
correct file  
and location. 

 

 
** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 
** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

  
  
On Mon, 29 Nov 2021 at 09:56, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Raymond, 

  

Any update? 
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Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 26 November, 2021 10:27 AM 
To: VAuG Claims 
Subject: RE: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  

Hi Raymond, 

  

Refer to attachment 

Audit checked some parts prices slightly high, necessary adjustment has to be made 

Finalised amount is $ 3,650 / 6 days of lump sum repair  

Kindly confirm 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: VAuG Claims [mailto:claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg]  
Sent: Thursday, 25 November, 2021 1:39 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  

Good afternoon, 

  

Please check the attachment 

  

Thanks! 

Best regards 

Raymond Teo 
 

 

Sin Ming AutoCity 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

Singapore 575722 

Showroom/Office: #03-03 

Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 

Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 
Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

  

  

On Thu, 25 Nov 2021 at 11:40, Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Raymond, 

  

Kindly email me the resurvey after repair photos 

  

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: VAuG Claims [mailto:claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 November, 2021 11:55 AM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: SLV7190E - SMRT TP - Finalization 

  

Good morning, 

  

Can we finalize the case? 
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Thanks! 

Best Regards 

Raymond Teo 

 

Sin Ming AutoCity 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

Singapore 575722 

Showroom/Office: #03-03 

Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 

Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 

Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 

  

  

On Tue, 16 Nov 2021 at 13:20, VAuG Claims <claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg> wrote: 

Good afternoon, 

  

Can we finalize the case? 

  

Thanks! 



9

Best regards 

Raymond Teo 
 

 

Sin Ming AutoCity 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

Singapore 575722 

Showroom/Office: #03-03 

Workshops: #08-08/09/10 

Tel: 64532121 (4 lines) 

Fax: 64599795 

Website: www.vinsautogroup.com.sg 
Email: claims@vinsautogroup.com.sg 
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** w.e.f 15th May 2017, we have shifted location! ** 

** w.e.f 20th November 2017, we have changed our email address! ** 


