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Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 November 2021 10:52 AM
To: Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: Own Damage Claim - ER5005A ROLLS ROYCE PHANTOM DOA: 28/09/2021

Dear All, 
 
Confirmed finalize COR $100,075. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best regards 
Victor Seng (Mr) 
Motor Claims Assistant Manager 
Mobile: (+65) 8318 9973 

 
www.ow.sg  
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz  

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  

 

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: 29 October, 2021 1:39 PM 
To: Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>; Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Own Damage Claim - ER5005A ROLLS ROYCE PHANTOM DOA: 28/09/2021 
 
Hi Victor, 
 
I have made some adjustment on the labour, this is our recommendation: 
  
Parts                :$  94,820.00 
S/N                   :$       575.00  
Labour             :$    4,680.00 
Part/Part        :$ 100,075.00 
 
Kindly check and revert. 
 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Victor Seng <victor.seng@ow.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 29 October 2021 1:21 PM 
To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Own Damage Claim - ER5005A ROLLS ROYCE PHANTOM DOA: 28/09/2021 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sir/Madm, 
  
Finalize - Own Damage Claim - ER5005A ROLLS ROYCE PHANTOM 
 
Calculation as per you recommendation: 
  
Parts                :$  94,820.00 
S/N                   :$       575.00  
Labour             :$    5,430.00 
Part/Part        :$ 100,825.00 
 
Kindly check and revert. 
 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best regards 
Victor Seng (Mr) 
Motor Claims Assistant Manager 
Mobile: (+65) 8318 9973 

 
www.ow.sg  
www.facebook.com/optimawerkz  

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not copy, distribute or use it for any 
purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Please notify the sender if you receive this email in error, and delete the email and its content 
immediately after which.  

 


