10/28/21, 3:38 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: To AMEND OIV# in Survey Report | || TPPD Survey Report || Claim: C10011905 ,
Claimed Policy: P10118888R02 , Policy Holder: Kok Siang Chow

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Thu 28/10/2021 3:38 PM

To: Eileen Lee <eileen.lee@budgetdirect.com.sg>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Eileen,
Amended done.
Sorry for the inconvenience caused

Best Regards,
Denise Tay | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Eileen Lee <eileen.lee@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 28 October 2021 10:13 am

To: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: To AMEND OIV# in Survey Report | | | TPPD Survey Report || Claim: C10011905, Claimed Policy:
P10118888R02, Policy Holder: Kok Siang Chow

Hi LKK,

OIV number is stated as SLX2000E, the correct OIV number should be SKX2000E
Please amend & resend the survey report & invoice.
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Please do not hesitate to call the undersigned should you require further assistance on weekdays,
9am-5pm, except Public Holidays.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Eileen Lee
Senior Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3693
F +65 6725 0853
E eileen.lee@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Customer Care +65 6989 3684
Claims +65 6989 3686
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10DBhLTcONjYINGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUWMGFhNWIXNAAQAMSOFIS5ck%2Bcu1P8L6PFRRA...  2/4


mailto:eileen.lee@budgetdirect.com.sg

10/28/21, 3:38 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
Singapore

239924

budgetdirect.com.sg

autodgeneral

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

From: Frauleine Khoo <frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 15 October 2021 3:26 pm

To: Eileen Lee <eileen.lee@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD Survey Report | | Claim: C10011905, Claimed Policy: P10118888R02 , Policy Holder: Kok Siang
Chow

Dear Eileen,

Please find attached survey report and documents from LKK for your kind action.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards,

Frauleine Khoo
Executive, Claims

T +65 6989 3696
F +65 6725 0853
E frauleine.khoo@budgetdirect.com.sg

It pays to choose Platinum

Customer Care +65 6989 3684
Claims +65 6989 3686
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments
(email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This
email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended
addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or
disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: Huey Yon <report@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 15 October 2021 3:22 pm

To: lvy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@budgetdirect.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMV 8012T ; YOUR REF : SLX 2000E - DOA ON 29/09/2021 || C10011905/EE

Dear lvy,

Enclosed the survey report.

Thanks & Regards,

Huey Yon | Reports

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111 Fax: 6741-4108 email: report@I|kkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA) Services
Pte. Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and is for
the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the views of
the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to
copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege
have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you
are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto
& General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.
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