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Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 1 September 2022 1:57 PM
To: Assessment Dept
Cc: SUR
Subject: RE: Re finalisation of SKJ 5093R

Dear Sir, 
 
Any updates? 
 
Best Regards, 
Huey Yon | case handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 
Phone: 6256-3561  Fax: 62564315  email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933 
 

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 4:55 PM 
To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>; Assessment Dept <assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Re finalisation of SKJ 5093R 
 
Dear Andrew, 
 
 
Please check and confirm your LOD have amend the COR to Lump Sum $14,000.00 instead of $16,300.00. 
Kindly acknowledge and reply to us of above matter asap. 
 
Best Regards, 

Huey Yon | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: hueyyon@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Saturday, 19 March 2022 1:45 PM 
To: Assessment Dept <assessment_ral@bifrostauto.com> 
Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re finalisation of SKJ 5093R 
 
Hi Andrew, 
 
Without Prejudice  
 
Attached is the amended estimate of SKJ 5093R 
 
We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $14,000/- with 7 days of repair, subject to their 
approval. 
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Please amend your LOD. 
 
Please take note that there was an error of offering the NV as the COR. 
My apologies for the error made. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


