11/19/21, 12:31 PM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ALONG/AT SERANGOON CENTRAL
ON 27/09/2021

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>
Fri 11/19/2021 12:31 PM

To: cauthentllp@singnet.com.sg <cauthentllp@singnet.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21010003/Gre3

CAUTHEN TRADING LLP- BY EMAIL ONLY
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144] ALONG/AT SERANGOON CENTRAL ON 27/09/2021
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by
your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third-party claim against your
policy.

We have received a claim from SHA 9144] against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your

driver’s Favour as your driver is coming out from minor road and collided with Third Party who is

travelling along main road. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the
Third Party.

TP VIDEO (1)

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement,
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third-Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGY 5MjASNjAXLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYJA20QBGAAAAAAApXOAAHQAET... 1/2



11/19/21, 12:31 PM Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

https://outlook.office.com/mail/sentitems/id/AAMKAGY 5MjASNjAXLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA20QBGAAAAAAApXOAAHQAET... 2/2


mailto:JaslinKok@lkkauto.com

Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 December 2021 9:37 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: AIG REF : 3991542226SG-003 || TP: SHA9144) (DOA: 26/09/2021)
Dear Jaslin

Please maintain our offer @50%. We also agreeable to escalate this matter to DRM should TP insist that Ol is 100%
liable for said accident.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Bennie Tan
Senior Complex Claims Examiner - Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1718

Bennie-WZ.Tan®@aig.com | www.AlG.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 December 2021 2:14 pm

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] AIG REF : 3991542226SG

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Bennie
We have proceeded to offer TP base on 50%.

However, they are of view that our insured is liable 100% and prepared to escalate to GIA for adjudication is
amicable settlement unable to reach.

Kindly let us have your instructions to maintain at 50%.

Thank you.
Best Regards,



Jaslin Kok | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.



Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 December 2021 3:17 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ON 27/09/2021*** LKK REF :
CC4/A1G21010003/Gre3

Dear Jaslin

We shall address our escalation to GIA and directly to AlG. Please advise the OIC of this claim matter.
Thank you.

Best Regards
Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

Do you really need to print? GD)
Go Digital' Go Paperless! 23L

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 29 December 2021 11:58 am

To: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ON 27/09/2021*** LKK REF : CC4/AIG21010003/Gre3

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment
unless you know the sender.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jim
We have our principal instructions to maintain at 50%.

Kindly re-consider.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
1



From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, December 6, 2021 11:28 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ON 27/09/2021*** LKK REF : CC4/AlG21010003/Gre3

Dear Jaslin

We of view your client is liable 100% of taxi's losses and prepared to escalate to GIA for adjudication is
amicable settlement unable to reach.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

Do you really need to print? GD)
Go Digital! Go Paperlzss! =3

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 December 2021 4:35 PM

To: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ON 27/09/2021*** LKK REF : CC4/AIG21010003/Gre3

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment
unless you know the sender.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

Based on your client's video, your client was changing lane at a yellow box. Whereby our insured has checked
clear, waited for a car to go pass before exiting. Therefore, we have our principal instructions resolve at 50/50.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $1,227.93

2. Loss of Rental (2.5 days x $125.19) $312.98

3. Loss of Income claim under BI
@50% $770.46

4. GIA Search Fee $2.00

Total | $772.46




Please confirm acceptance.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, October 26, 2021 3:06 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ON 27/09/2021*** LKK REF : CC4/AIG21010003/Gre3

Final stage.

Best Regards
Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd

to print? o0
: less! =L

From: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 October 2021 3:05 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ON 27/09/2021*** LKK REF : CC4/AIG21010003/Gre3

Dear Jaslin
Please find the attached video footage.

“The video footage is confidential information. In possessing, using or viewing the CCTV footage, you do not acquire any rights, title
or interest in the CCTV footage and undertake to preserve its confidentiality. By downloading, using or viewing the video, you agree
that you will not disclose, provide, reproduce, store, transmit or otherwise make available the CCTV footage, in whole or in part, to
your client or any third party.”

Thank you.
Best Regards

Jim Wong
Claims Dept / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
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From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 October 2021 12:58 PM

To: Jim Wong See Pah <jimwong@cdge.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBK 7327E & SHA 9144) ON 27/09/2021*** LKK REF : CC4/A1G21010003/Gre3

CAUTION : This email originated from an external party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or open attachment

unless you know the sender.

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that OI has reported. Please refer to the below OI's sketch plan and statement.

Sketch Plan ’!/‘rlf 2 .'rl")ff P 5 Py rr.
T T rErirTT ’T'hﬂm; AT o o ot

‘:—n:_u_la ' _— -t—rj—:—rn“‘4_'_ | . : : ‘ . : :
L y— R e ; i | 1 Ll
- B —'—'-:-'T —— - ' ' Ll ! i ' | { |
el AEEE ! L b3 | ] L Py i I
6 N Il - i - - — : .
L i i 1 __+__I !._,;.T___.'__,._ Ll *L e | L1 i B PR :
e - ! | ] | |
. B 1 1 1 ] I r

i - - -

. _! = | B
{111 4
| |
117 l

o S : : .
B AR ' AR MRS RPHRGER
{- | HEEBE® SE @ E ENNCRET

o 2 R e 11T ‘“t r-T—'—J—"'—'“-*—"—'—'—" ] !

N

:_L-;"|—.|.nTL-|--—--~.'-+—r—

.

r—-'l Ti— '_'__!_"1 1----1'—'!--. 1—-1,-—--4 i-n-q- — - §
¥ i
S LS O N e A R T el 0 T RN e S R |

=

A-GRAT327€



Duf:_ ribe Circumstances of the Accident

* o Rle niove Neohy s

N Vi Yame - Be VA W Aoy
'1"‘1&_-5-- Ft}m“ tbdh VW \.:":L\’\\C-k«\_
< 1 -

Please provide us a copy of accident video as stated in your client accident report for our viewing.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us
and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is
not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to
print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us
and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is
not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to
print this only if necessary.



ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient, kindly notify us
and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or disclosing any contents therein is
not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matter outside our business are not to be taken as endorsed by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its
related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a
binding agreement between the parties. Neither party shall be bound in any way to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement
signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office certified by the Singapore Environment Council - is committed to preserving the environment. We encourage you to
print this only if necessary.

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd [Registration No. 199506048W]




