Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 14 December 2021 4:27 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Accident Involving Vehicle GZ2072) and GBD6963L (YOUR INSURED ) ON 22/9/2021
*** LKK REF: CC4/11121009981/ga3

Attachments: GZ2072 RENTAL.pdf;, GZ2072).pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Cecilia

We submit our claim as follow

Repair Cost  S$ 2996.00
Loss of Used S§ 480.00 ( 4days )
Total : S$ 3476.00

Please let us have your offer to settle

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email : jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 September 2021 10:56 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cec: jin@jinauto.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
<CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ***SPAM*** RE: [EXTERNAL] - Accident Involving Vehicle GZ2072J and GBD6963L (YOUR
INSURED ) ON 22/9/2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/11121009981/ga3

Dear Jouis,

We refer to the above matter.

Please provide us the following and arrange for survey.
e evidence i.e. video and scene photo

e PIRresult (if any)
e estimated cost of repair
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Sigmed By :

1/ We, Q’?"‘f\\, H!qul MM i Lo the owner of Vehicle

Registration Number 62 ')0}”,3 have been advised by them and understand the

content of my/our motor claim as specify herein:

Type of Claim : D Claim Own-Policy Only
@ Direct Settlement With Third Party Insurer

A compulsory policy excess ~ stated in the Motor Policy taken up by you is
applicable for own damage claim.

You have my/our full authority to negotiate a settlement with the third party and/or
his/her/their insurers on such terms as you deem fit. Upon settlement of my/our claim, you are
autherised to sign any Discharge Voucher or any document to confirm my/our acceptance of
the settlement as full and final discharge of my/our claim, on my/our hehalf.

Loss Of Use and Cost Of Rental shall be computed in accordance to the number of days as
recommended by the surveyor and the benchmark rates published in State Court Practice
Direction for Non-Injury Motor Accident {NIViA) Claims.

I/We, am/are fully aware that Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd is assisting me/us in my/our Third Party
insurer, I/We shall release Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd against any liability, loss claim or
proceedings which may arise out of or in the course of or by reason of execution of the services.

In the event that Third Party Insurer is not prepared to settle the claim due to breach of policy
or ather reasons, you may without referring to us to commence legal proceedings against Third
Party on our behalf to recover the damages. If/We shall render my/our co-operation for the
legat claim process. The entire amount claimed shall belong and make payable to Jin Auto
Services Pte Lid absolutely.

TION-CONTRACTOR

NRIC: Date: 30/09/2021
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NSURANCE Office (65) 63476100 Email  insure@iii.com.sg

SINGAPORE - P :
Sivving thd rgho sow 1567 Fax (65) 62244174 Website www.iii.com.sg

EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

DISCHARGE VOUCHER
Ill-Direct Settlement (PODS)

India Ref: MCV2021D0004234
Claimant Ref: GZ 2072J

well, JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD ("the workshop") hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement
with the appointed Surveyor of India International Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name
of Surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$$3,400.00(global sum) (EepeH—eeeHmmEE Gesensh
VOSSN S ——(esessnmieey, \chicle no. GZ 2072J that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on_22/9/2021 (date) at__AYE TOWARDS JURONG TOWN HALL  (iocation) involving vehicle no.GBD 6963L (insured
vehicle). This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 30/09/2021 (date) at “the workshop”.

Wel/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner PENG HENG RENOVATION CONTRACTOR ("the third party
claimant") of vehicle no. GZ 2072Jto make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle

the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third

party claimant".

Wel/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify India International Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages, loss and/or expense that
they will or have already incurred in the event that "the third party claimant" after the above said agreement lodges a
further claim against the former for any loss and expenses suffered pertaining to cost of repairs and/or rental and/or loss
of use pursuant to the damage to GZ 2072J (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of all claims of "the third party claimant"

pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without prejudice and without admission of liability

basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive jurisdiction over any

dispute arising out of the same.

We/l authorize youto pay the total amount of S$ 3,400.00 to_JIN AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

Dated this .20.... day of . MAY 20 22.
CLAIMANT: PN WITNESS:
Signature: . 5:55&3&, S Signature: Cxg
signgd by "the WWM chop) Signed by appointed Surveyor
Name: Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd Name: LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
NRIC: NRIC: 199607198R
Address: Blk 14 Defu Lane 10, #01-410/412 ;s 51 UBI AVE 1, PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
SINGAPORE 539195 #02-25 SINGAPORE 408933
Nationality: Nationality:

Occupation: Occupation:
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Email: jin@jinauto.com.sg
Company Reg. No: 200704370C GST Reg. No: 200704370C

| TAX INVOICE
Mis W\AW /(J/“u*’ il ‘\M Q’\—“”‘W( : TnvoiceNo: 1 8422

et TN
Vehicle No: &l J-CXT"‘ ' _
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N.B No responsibility will be accepted for any loss or E. & O.E. ADD GST || “+ ‘ Y b1t
damage to any Vehicles or parts left in this workshop - = -
for any reason whatsoever. P AP A | L
toraL | £ 15




HUI WANG EN 570 /576, SINGAPORE 530186

E 10, #01 ' ;
iy slz'gg 4541, 6283 0717 | FAX: 323;00342 o
MA!I E\i&iwangSTG@Gmail.com | GST No.
E !

TAX INVOICE

. 3
To Invoice No. : 000233521
. : 20
Jin Auto Daite . 1101 01572
Reference : RA24
Vehicle Number
Repair Date
i UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
! DESCRIPTION -
T $120.00 $480.
4 Rentatl of GBA1961R From 30/9/21 to 4/10/21
S’
!
| —
INTEREST AT THE RATE 1.5% PER MONTH WILL BE CHARGE ON OVERDUE ACCOUNTS Sub-Total $480.00 —
GST 7% $33.60
Total Payable $513.60
Payment Options

Pleasa note that if you wish to make payment via Bank Transfer or Cheque, indicate the Bank, Amount

Transfer & Invoice Number in the email so we are able to confirm that the funds came through. The email
can be sent to Accounts@HuiWangEnterprise.com

OCBC SGD Account

Bank Name: Oversea-Chinese Banking Corporation Limited
Account Number: 689 021 566 001
Account Name; Hui Wang Enterprise Private Limited

UEN: 201426468N

Received By Issued By

E.&O.E




e ERAR K E
W HUI WANG ENTERPRISE PTE LTD

BLK 5, DEFU LANE 10, # 01-576, SINGAPORE 539186 |
TEL: 6286 4541, 6283 0717 FAX: 6281 0647 No24572

Co. Reg. No. 201426468N

g FEBA o RFKE  BE R ATRTH
LORRY, VAN RENTAL, VEHICLES INSPECTION, REPAIRING, SPRAY PAINTING, PANEL BEATING, INSURANCE CLAIM, ETC.

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

1/C No:

Tel No:

HIRER’S PARTICULARS } We

If Different From Section 1

of

m Messts Hui Wang Enterprise Pte Ltd the undermentioned NEW/USED Vehicles at the

I shall be responsible for the first payment of $2,000.00/ $3,000.00 for any losg
e to pay Messrs Hui Wang Enterprise Pte Ltd the value of the vehicle in
lting from THEFT or DESTRUCTION of the said vehicle whether
£ the terms and conditions of hire, hereinafter mentioned

hereby confirm having agreed to hire this day fro
rental fees as shown below and Iagree that
and/or damaged caused to the said vehicle and I shall be responsibl
the event of the Vehicle being CONFISCATED or any loss resu
or notsuch damage or loss is caused by negligence or by any breach by me o

= printed.
<
Vehicle Redg. No. # 3% @5/9 / ? 6 / £ @Petrol)
Section 1 Hirer's And / Or Driver's Partticutars 41L& & \ & B¢ & 18 A 32 #% ] f{le%%ﬁe"%ﬁ: 20 /4/ | ra~f em
EECR N . m
Name & ANG K/IHm)  TECK Bt s Tmo I /Jof21 | D-G &7
Address it Bk 6346 HIVEANG  AVE & £ ¥ Days @$
#07- (70 SE. 873p6>4 | ZH Weeks @$

. b, .

gféﬁence No: 1/C No: & /3 47872 TeiNo: 9732¢76£6% | A Months@ §

Ak B 2

Expiry Date Date Of Birth ¢ 4 " 2 / ﬁs # ¥ Nett-Total

Vo N, (Diesel / Petrol) | 444 Deposit

A A4 AR B )

Date & Time 05’(: Refund

nH B R E [
Date & Tin%lea?:n:‘} Balance To Pay
* Note: A repossession fee of $$100.00 will be charged on repossess vehicles Cash / Cheque
NOTIGES : ACCIDENT EXCESS: 3 o'lg\oo X2 6? Fﬁuili#fnk our | % T 3 ’;“ ’g‘ % % F
NO INSURANCE COVERAGE FOR YOUNG (BELOW___), OLD (ABOVE ) 2
AND IN EXPERIENCED DRIVERS. . %‘; g&fg cifional Charges

Wi E AR TR LA AR,
Please check Radiator Water & Engine O daily.

FiE AR, BAMRT, ERRBAL DI,
Extra charges are required for those vehicle that run out of petrol, lost of key and etc.

Interest rate of 1.5% will be charged on overdue payments

IMPORTANT!

L
‘1 / We declare that the usage of renting the above mention Vehicle are not to be used for ille i i
C : : 9 urpose,\ncludin

offences in connection with thefts, uncustomed goods, drugs dealings or trafficking or smuggling. ’ ?

s

— Sigfatule b Her

I/We hereby accept the terms and conditions herein and overleaf which I have read and unde i

[ ) rstood or have been read over and explain to me
and understood by me. I/We hereby declare that the particulars of the Hirer and licence given above are correct i espect an% that ] am
the holder of a valid driving licence enabing me to drive the above-mentioned vehicle and d from driving.

Remarks: y

z_/""r\ A M
Signature of Hirer FALH B




5/13/22, 11:49 AM Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*GZ2072J (MCV2021D0004234)
[GBD6963L]
TP
PENG HENG RENOVATION CONTRACTOR
Sep 22 2021 12:00AM
[L&D INTERIOR CONTRACTOR PTE LTD]
Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

From India International Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (IlI_SG), sent on 27/04/2022 14:51 PM.

To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3424.00) - GZ2072J - Claim Handler: Sundari Nagarajan

Approved:3424.00:Agreed to do direct settlement. Revert with your quantum advice.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=94275798&CFTOKEN=93010dadbd28423b-52685...  1/1





