EzLyna (LKKAuto)

From: EzLyna (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 4:06 PM

To: Lee, Ming-Yao

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: MANDATE TO OFFER LIABILITY @80% GLOBAL SUM / Traffic Accident at Marine

Parade Rd on 23sept 2021- letter to Traffic Police 30/12/2021 | AIG Ref : 3074072558SG

Dear Ming Yao,
We refer to the above matter and your previous correspondence with Ms Cecilia.

Third party workshop rejected 50% liability as our Insured’s driver was giving Stern Warning from Traffic Police. To save
cost on both sides, we would like to seek your approval to settle this claim Global Sum @ 80% liability.

Please refer quantum on Merimen.

Kindly advise. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Ezlyna Eng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: Ezlyna@Ikkauto.com |

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 October 2022 3:16 PM

To: EzLyna (LKKAuto) <ezlyna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Traffic Accident at Marine Parade Rd on 23sept 2021- letter to Traffic Police 30/12/2021 | AIG Ref :
3074072558SG

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 2:48 pm

To: Lee, Ming-Yao <MingYao.Lee@aig.com>

Subject: RE: Traffic Accident at Marine Parade Rd on 23sept 2021- letter to Traffic Police 30/12/2021 | AIG Ref:
3074072558SG

Hi Ming Yao,

Yes, sure. Content noted with thanks



