Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 January 2022 2:35 pm

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: #1418972843SG004#023# << AlG Ref // Acct involving GBJ9790S (Ol) & SHB4029L

on 18/09/21 *** LKK REF: CC4/AlG21009815/Vga3

Hi Cecilia,
Please proceed with 50/50 as stated in your below email.

Kindly ensure insured is cleared before any settlement, and upload correspondence with insured into Merimen.
Thank you.

Loh Chee Heng
Senior Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1881
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com | www.AlG.sg

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 4 January 2022 2:22 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: #14189728435G004#023# << AlG Ref // Acct involving GBJ9790S (Ol) & SHB4029L on 18/09/21
*** KK REF: CC4/AIG21009815/Vga3

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Chee Heng,

TP video uploaded in merimen.

We are in the view that liability shouldn’t be fully absorb by Ol as TP fully stop even after changing of lane that caused
Ol to collide into TPV.

Kindly let us have your view in this matter. We are in the opinion that liability should be shared equally.

Thanks



