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culare
Owner 1D Type
Dwner 1D
Vehicle Detail
Vehicle No
Vehicle to be Exporied:
Intended Dereglstration Date
Vehicle Make
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour.
Manufacturing Year
Engine No.:
Chassis No.
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
PQP Paid:
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
Message
Please note that the 8

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 22 Sep 2021

-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry o

Comnpany
B2IR

SHDA7A4B

No

22 5ep 20214

TOYOTA

PRIUS SDR HATCHBACK [AUTO)
Blue

2020

2ZR2G75061
JTDKBIFUX03091159
90.0 kW (120 bhp)
$26,807.00

28 Feb 2020

28 Feb 2020

0

$14,530.00

Yes
27 Feb 2028
$10,897.00

27 Feb 2028

A-Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
8

$26,431.00

$21,247,00

$32,144,00
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RE: Accident involvin

SHD oo
provided later) g 37448 and your insured SMA2041) dated 17.09.2021 (SAS

AIG SGP, Claims-Surve

Mon 20/9/70:1 o 32 AM

y <AIGSGPQCIaimsSurvey@aig.com>

To: Lim Tien Slong <limts@cdge com sg>

CAUTION : This email originated from an extern
Open attachment unless you know the sender.

al party outside ComfortDelGro. Do not click on links or

Hi Sir,

We'll appoint LKK to conduct survey.

Thanks.

AIG Claims Survey

From: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, September 20, 2021 9:00 AM
To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <A|GSGP_CIaimsSurvev@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Accident involving SHD3744B and your insured SMA2041J dated 17.09.2021 (SAS
provided later)

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Officer in charge,

Best Regards,

Lim Tien Siong

Taxi Accident Repair / ComfortDelgro Engineering Pte Ltd
Off:62148398 / Fax:65468156

From: canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg <canon@comfortdelgro.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 20 September 2021 8:51 AM

To: Lim Tien Siong <limts@cdge.com.sg>

Subject: Scan Image

This message and any attachments may contain confidential, privileged or proprietary information. If you are not the intended recipient,
kindly notify us and delete this message and its attachments immediately, and please be advised that using, copying, distributing or
disclosing any contents therein is not allowed. Statements pertaining to any matler oulside our business are not to be taken as endorsed
by ComfortDelGro Corporation Limited or its related companies. The comments/proposals provided are for discussion purposes only and
are subject to approvals. Nothing herein shall constitute a binding agreement between the partles. Neither party shall be bound in any way
to any term or condition except as agreed in a written agreement signed by the duly authorised representatives of both parties.

ComfortDelGro - a Green Office cerlified by the Singapore Environment Council - is commitied to preserving the environment. We



