Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 November 2021 4:06 pm

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKJ477A / WIP 46181
Dear Paul,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Confirm final fig $6,317.93 before excess $2,500.00 & GST and 3 repair days.

Kindly assist to amend your tax invoice.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 7:50 pm

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>
Subject: Re: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKJ477A / WIP 46181

Hi Shiau Chan,

I've checked the finalize. Kindly assist.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>
Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 2:08 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKJ477A / WIP 46181

For closing

Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com  paul.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Isteh.tcl@yahoo.com <Isteh.tcl@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, November 12, 2021 9:30 AM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>; Chew Boon Siong <boonsiong.chew@wearnes.com>
Cc: tclautomobile@yahoo.com.sg

Subject: RE: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKI477A / WIP 46181

Hi Paul,
Good morning.

Please find the attached photos of the damaged part upon dismantled from the subject vehicle and the photo
before painting for your record purpose

No supplementary part was found.
Thank you.

Warmest regards,

Teh

TCL Automobile Pte Ltd

2 Jalan Pesawat, #01-00
Singapore 619358

Tel / Fax: +65-6264 5808
Mobile: +65-8840 6679
Email: Isteh.tcl@yahoo.com

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 2 November 2021 4:09 PM

To: Chew Boon Siong <boonsiong.chew@wearnes.com>
Cc: Teh - TCL Automobile <Isteh.tcl@yahoo.com>
Subject: RE: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKJ477A / WIP 46181

Can re-order new piece first.

This current piece don’t dispose first in case owner send in. try to buy time till the new one arrive



Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com paul.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Chew Boon Siong <boonsiong.chew@wearnes.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 2, 2021 4:08 PM

To: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>

Cc: Teh - TCL Automobile <Isteh.tcl@yahoo.com>

Subject: RE: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKJ477A / WIP 46181

Paul,

Last pcs, if cannot need reorder.

Thanks .

From: Paul Ong Qing Yong <paul.ong@wearnes.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 2, 2021 3:55 PM

To: Chew Boon Siong <boonsiong.chew@wearnes.com>
Cc: Teh - TCL Automobile <Isteh.tcl@yahoo.com>
Subject: RE: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKJ477A / WIP 46181

Siong,
TCL advise bumper has a scratch mark . refer attached

Paul Ong

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
45 Leng Kee Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 8126 1237 D (65) 6378 9336
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com paul.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Alan Chan <alan.chan@wearnes.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 21, 2021 2:20 PM

To: B&P Service Consultants <bnpsc@wearnes.com>

Cc: Jeremy Lim <jeremy.lim@wearnes.com>; Teh - TCL Automobile <Isteh.tcl@yahoo.com>;
tclautomobile@yahoo.com.sg; Eugene Tan <eugene.tan@wearnes.com>; Chua Wee How




<weehow.chua@wearnes.com>; Chew Boon Siong <boonsiong.chew@wearnes.com>
Subject: JLR PARTS ARRIVAL SKJ477A / WIP 46181

Hi All,
Parts have been arrived.

Please take note.

CYK Chan Yew Kwong SKJ477A RR Evoque Si4 5 Door 2.0L |

WIP number: I*f“‘fﬂgd| J Parts order | ﬂﬂﬂﬂ”"tl thiﬂﬂsl Dfﬂﬂ[| DDQES| Notes

~ Customer Account code: ICG{}G{H
ROCHE DIAGNOSTICS ASIA PACIFIC PTEJ
Attn: Mr Anton Gutscher Curren
214 Ocean Drive oy
ISGD | 1.0000(
Address Ok
098623
Work: 63716632 J
Payment Date: IEM 0/2021 Terms:
199803381W
—New product WIP status—
J ILR Land Rover j {L IM |
Line | T |Product Description Menu (W
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Best Regards,

ALAN CHAN YEW KWONG

Warehouse & Logistics
Parts Dept

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
V 2 Jalan Pesawat Singapore 619358
T (65) 6264 31543 F (65) 6264 8549
WEARMNMES www.wearnesauto.com  wa.partspdi@wearnes.com

Disclaimer:
This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.

If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.

Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.






