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RE: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021

Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Mon 25/10/2021 2:30 PM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Without prejudice
 
Dear Denise
 
Amount confirmed $12,032.25(before GST).
 



10/25/21, 2:37 PM Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQkAGNlMTQ1ODBhLTc0NjYtNGE3OC05NWVkLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIxNAAQAMH3GEkOzEUUgihLNEuR9… 2/7

 
 
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308
 
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764
 
 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com] 

Sent: Monday, 25 October, 2021 11:29 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Re: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Hi Wai Yin,
 
i've check with him, his caculation is not correct it should be $12,032.25.
 
Can amend the figure?
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

mailto:claims@transcab.com.sg
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 11:13 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Ok, ok. You let me know again J
 
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308
 
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764
 
 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com] 

Sent: Monday, 25 October, 2021 11:12 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Re: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Hi,
 
i check with kenneth cause cannot get his amount
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 11:10 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
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Dear Denise,
 
Nope, cos I saw my colleague Mr Zhe Wei already issue invoice with follow Kenneth amount.
 
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308
 
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764
 
 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com] 

Sent: Monday, 25 October, 2021 11:09 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Re: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Hi Wai Yin,
 
will you be able to calculate out his amount?
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 October 2021 11:02 am

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: FW: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Without prejudice
 
Dear Denise
 
We will follow Kenneth recommended amount $14,061.70(Before GST).
 
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
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Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308
 
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764
 
 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com] 

Sent: Monday, 25 October, 2021 8:19 AM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Re: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Dear Wai Yin,
 
Any updates?
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 
 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 October 2021 6:20 pm

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Re: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Hi Wai Yin,
 
 
Enclosed Kenneth marking. base on my calculation is $12032.25, 6days
 
 
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 October 2021 3:14 pm

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Re: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Dear Wai Yin,
 
let me check with kenneth and get back to you
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 21 October 2021 3:10 pm

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: AAD2109-063 SHD9762J DOA 14/09/2021
 
Without prejudice
 
Dear Denise
 
Attached is before paint photos for your info.
 
Can I know Kenneth recommended how much of the repair cost?
 
Thank You
Best Regards,
Ng Wai Yin
Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308
 
* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg
* Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 30 days, failing which we shall proceed to hand over the
conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further reference to you.
 
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666  Fax: 6287 7764
 
 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com] 

Sent: Thursday, 21 October, 2021 2:48 PM

To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: SHD 9762J DOA 14/09/2021
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Hi,
 
Would like to follow up if repair done, can finalise?
 
Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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