
1

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 2:04 PM

To: Azhari Afidi; Reports (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SLF 9415D NTUC Ref: MT/1144754-001

Dear Azhari, 

 

The ERV of vehicle SLF 9415D are as below: 

Market Value     : $44,000.00(est) 

LTA Rebate         : $23,340.00 

Nett Value          : $20,660.00 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Azhari Afidi <azhari.afidi@income.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 6 July 2022 12:22 PM 

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SLF 9415D NTUC Ref: MT/1144754-001 

 

Classification: Restricted  

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Shiau Chan 

 

Thank You for your reply. 

 

We also woulld  like to know what is the  ERV for the Third Party Vehicle, SLF 9415D. 

 

The year made of the vehicle is in 2008. 

 

 

Thanks & Regards 

 

 

Azhari 
Claims Executive 

Operations, Motor & Personal Lines  

 

T:  +65 64307925 
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From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 2:33 PM 

To: Azhari Afidi <azhari.afidi@income.com.sg>; Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SLF 9415D NTUC Ref: MT/1144754-001 

 

[CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or open attachments 

unless you can confirm the sender and know the content is safe.] 

 

Dear Azhari, 
 

As per your requested. 
 
Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Azhari Afidi <azhari.afidi@income.com.sg>  

Sent: Monday, 4 July 2022 12:37 PM 

To: Reports (LKKAuto) <report@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SLF 9415D NTUC Ref: MT/1144754-001 

 

Classification: Restricted  

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sir, 
 

We refer to the above claim. 
 

Do you have a copy of THrd Party  LTA details for vehicle SLF9415D market value?. 
 

I have try to go to LTA website but unable to get the details. 
 

 

Thanks & Regards 

 

 

Azhari 
Claims Executive 

Operations, Motor & Personal Lines  

 

T:  +65 64307925 

 
 

 

 You don't often get email from siewsc@lkkauto.com. Learn why this is important  
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From: HueyYon (LKK Auto) <report@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 19 May 2022 8:40 AM 

To: ODsupport <ODsupport@income.com.sg> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Survey Report & Invoice of Vehicle SLF 9415D NTUC Ref: MT/1144754-001 

 

 

 
 

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 

 

Enclose Survey Report of  SLF 9415D 

 

 

Thank you. 
 

 

Best Regards,    

Huey Yon | Reports 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd. 

Phone: 6256-3561 Ext.111   Fax: 6741-4108   email: report@lkkauto.com 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #01-25 Singapore 408933 

 

 

 

Disclaimer  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the 

recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately 

and delete all copies of it. Thank you. 

Disclaimer  

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) 

named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies 

of it. Thank you. 


