Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 April 2022 5:08 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

From: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 April 2022 5:07:39 pm (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rico 60 Claims <claims@rico60.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh,
Offer accepted. Thank you.

Rico

On Fri, 8 Apr 2022 at 17:05, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

“Without Prejudice”

We will be advising our Principal a cost of repair of LS $16,000/- with 20 days of repair, subject to their
approval.

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: claims@rico60.com [mailto:claims@rico60.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 April 2022 11:23 PM

To: 'Enquiry'; "TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM'; 'Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)'; 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)'; 'Cecilia Chong (LKK
Auto)'; 'Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)'; 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'

Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear LKK,



Please assist to finalise this case for us.

Attached after paint.

Thanks

RICO

From: claims@rico60.com <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2022 3:22 PM

To: 'Enquiry' <enquiry@rico60.com>; 'TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM' <TAUFIKH@Ikkauto.com>; 'Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)'
<jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>; 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)'
<ceciliachong@lkkauto.com>; 'Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)' <huizhen@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'
<denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh,

Please assist to revert with finalization.

Thanks.

RICO

From: claims@rico60.com <claims@rico60.com>

Sent: Monday, March 21, 2022 7:01 PM

To: 'Enquiry' <engquiry@rico60.com>; 'TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM' <TAUFIKH@Ikkauto.com>; 'Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)'
<jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>; 'Celine Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)'
<ceciliachong@lkkauto.com>; 'Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)' <huizhen@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)'
<denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh,

Please assist to finalize the above case?



Thank you .

RICO

From: Enquiry <enquiry@rico60.com>

Sent: Tuesday, March 8, 2022 2:53 PM

To: 'TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM' <TAUFIKH@Ikkauto.com>; 'Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)' <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>; 'Celine
Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>; ‘Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <ceciliachong@Ikkauto.com>; 'Hui Zhen
(LKK Auto)' <huizhen@Ikkauto.com>; 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@rico60.com>

Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh,

Kindly assist in sending us the finalization offer for this case.

Thank You

Best Regards,

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

From: Enquiry [mailto:enquiry@rico60.com]

Sent: Monday, February 21, 2022 12:23 PM

To: 'TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM' <TAUFIKH@Ikkauto.com>; 'Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)' <jaslinkok@I|kkauto.com>; 'Celine
Fong (LKKAuto)' <celinefong@Ikkauto.com>; ‘Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)' <ceciliachong@Ikkauto.com>; 'Hui Zhen
(LKK Auto)' <huizhen@Ikkauto.com>; 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Claims' <claims@rico60.com>

Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh,



Kindly advise if finalization offer is ready?

Thank You

Best Regards,

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

From: Accounts [mailto:claims@rico60.com]

Sent: Saturday, February 12, 2022 11:08 AM

To: TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM,; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
<celinefong@Ilkkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <ceciliachong@Ikkauto.com>; Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)
<huizhen@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay @I|kkauto.com>

Cc: Rico 60 Enquiry <enquiry@rico60.com>

Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh,

Is the finalization offer for the above case ready ??

Thank you.

Best Regards,

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

From: Enquiry
Sent: Friday, 28 January 2022 1:08 PM

To: TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Hui Zhen (LKK
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Auto); Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Cc: Rico 60 Enquiry
Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

Dear Taufikh

Kindly provide us an update regarding the finalization for this case

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jacqueline Ng

From: Claims

Sent: Saturday, 8 January 2022 12:52 PM

To: TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM,; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Hui Zhen (LKK
Auto); Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Cc: Rico 60 Enquiry
Subject: RE: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

REMINDER FOR FINALIZATION

Dear Taufikh,

Kindly assist to finalise.

Thank you

Regards,

Prescelia Hoe



From: Rico 60 Claims [mailto:claims@rico60.com]

Sent: Tuesday, November 30, 2021 7:22 AM

To: TAUFIKH@LKKAUTO.COM,; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
<celinefong@Ikkauto.com>; Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <ceciliachong@Ikkauto.com>; Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)
<huizhen@lkkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Rico 60 Enquiry <enquiry@rico60.com>

Subject: Re: SLF 9415 D - TOYOTA ALTIS ------ FINALIZE

hi taufikh,

REMINDER FINALIZE

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.

Pls check & revert to us soon.

Thank you.

Regards,

alen

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com

On Mon, Nov 15, 2021 at 8:00 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims @rico60.com> wrote:
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HI Taufikh

REMINDER FINALIZE

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.

Pls check & revert to us soon.

Thank you.

Regards,

xiong

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com

On Sat, Oct 30, 2021 at 7:43 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims @rico60.com> wrote:

HI Taufikh,

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.



Attached check item 3

Pls check & revert to us soon.

Regards,

xiong

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com

On Sat, Oct 30, 2021 at 7:42 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims @rico60.com> wrote:

HI Taufikh,

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.

Attached check item 2

Pls check & revert to us soon.

Regards,

xiong



RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com

On Sat, Oct 30, 2021 at 7:38 AM Rico 60 Claims <claims @rico60.com> wrote:

HI Taufikh,

Kindly assist us to finalize this case.

Attached check item 1

Pls check & revert to us soon.

Regards,

xiong

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.



Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims @rico60.com

Regards,

Jesski Low

RICO 60 AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201807623M

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4, Premier @ Kaki Bukit
#02-24, Singapore 415875

Tel: +65 6286 6060 | Fax: +65 6286 7060
Email: claims@rico60.com
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