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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Renemer Bagang <renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 23 December 2021 5:02 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Marcus Chua (LKKAuto)

Cc: Mars Ler

Subject: RE: GBF 2358A-DOA: 14/9/21 (FCI OD)

Attachments: GBF2358A FIN.pdf; 72398f57-6d77-43e5-9a8b-9d6d910f9fa2.jpg; 

ef9777a3-159d-427d-bcce-59689df51e95.jpg; 3236d4ca-c299-4b1e-

a535-9c1839c91605.jpg; 0a4bb1a3-1ac4-41ff-a9b1-24e64e40729e.jpg; 689f13e8-

f83c-4895-9ff4-8b4f7b3dec19.jpg; d13d094c-fe4c-4892-ab37-cc814138eecb.jpg

Dear Veron, 

 

The repair has been completed. 

 

Aside > Marcus 

 

Please see attached files for your reference & finalization. 

 

Thank you, 

 

Best Regards, 
 

Ren Bagang 
Motor Claims Service Advisor 
H/P +65 85523293        D/D 65949166 
email : renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg 
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd 
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650 
Tel : 67461000  Fax : 64875857 

 
 
 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: 23 December 2021 14:17 

To: Renemer Bagang 

Cc: Mars Ler 
Subject: RE: GBF 2358A-DOA: 14/9/21 (FCI OD) 

 

Dear Mars/Renemer, 

 

 

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Renemer Bagang [mailto:renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 22 November 2021 3:06 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Mars Ler <mars.ler@ccfulco.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: GBF 2358A-DOA: 14/9/21 (FCI OD) 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

We are still waiting for the spare parts to arrive. 

 

Thank you, 

 

Best Regards, 
 

Ren Bagang 
Motor Claims Service Advisor 
H/P +65 85523293        D/D 65949166 
email : renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg 
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd 
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650 
Tel : 67461000  Fax : 64875857 

 
 
 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 22 November 2021 14:38 

To: Renemer Bagang 
Cc: Mars Ler 

Subject: RE: GBF 2358A-DOA: 14/9/21 (FCI OD) 

 

Dear Mars/Renemer, 

 

 

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Renemer Bagang <renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg>  

Sent: Wednesday, 13 October 2021 11:21 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: Mars Ler <mars.ler@ccfulco.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: GBF 2358A-DOA: 14/9/21 (FCI OD) 

 

Dear Veron, 

 

Please be advise that the vehicle hasn’t started the repair, we are still waiting for the spare parts to arrive.  

 

Thank you, 

 

Best Regards, 
 

Ren Bagang 
Motor Claims Service Advisor 
H/P +65 85523293        D/D 65949166 
email : renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg 
Cycle & Carriage Fulco Motor Dealer Pte Ltd 
330 UBI Road 3 Singapore 408650 
Tel : 67461000  Fax : 64875857 

 
 
 
 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 13 October 2021 11:16 
To: Mars Ler; Renemer Bagang 

Subject: RE: GBF 2358A-DOA: 14/9/21 (FCI OD) 

 

Dear Mars/Renemer, 

 

 

Kindly advise vehicle status. 

 

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.  

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Friday, 17 September 2021 10:58 AM 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; mars.ler@ccfulco.com.sg; renemer.bagang@ccfulco.com.sg 

Subject: GBF 2358A-DOA: 14/9/21 (FCI OD) 

 

Dear Mars/ Renemer,                                          

 

 

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle GBF 2358A, Not Exceeding 
repair cost $10,500/-, (Excess $600). 
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If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel: 

6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.  

 

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company 

before completion of the repair. 

 

*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair. 
 

 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 


