Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Saturday, 25 September 2021 8:44 PM

To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Finalize For SLL3224X (DOA 13/09/2021) - TP (SMRT)
Attachments: SLL 3224 finalize.pdf

Hi Hui Zhen,

Workshop agreed finalize.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 25 September 2021 10:16 am

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Finalize For SLL3224X (DOA 13/09/2021) - TP (SMRT)

Without Prejudice
Dear Steve,
We hereby confirm COR @ $1250 (L/S, before GST). 3 repair days.

Thank you.

Regards,

Vivian Tan

Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd
|



Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride

On Fri, 24 Sept 2021 at 14:50, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Hi Vivian,

Kindly refer our finalize $1250 (L/S, before GST). 3 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Tan <vivian.pegasusengrg@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 24 September 2021 2:05 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalize For SLL3224X (DOA 13/09/2021) - TP (SMRT)

Without Prejudice

Dear Mr. Steve,

Finalise COR @ L/S S$1,250.00 (before GST)
03 working days

Attach the estimate and after paint photos for your reference.



Please check & revert for confirmation.

Thank you & warmest regards

Regards,
Vivian Tan
Pegasus Engineering & Trading Pte Ltd

Tel : 6513 7748 | Fax : 6251 3161
Add : 74 Kian Teck Road Singapore 628800

Make Life a Beautiful Ride



