Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 December 2021 8:42 AM
To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Final Bill : SLQ5374G
Attachments: SLQ 5374 SUPPL.png

Hi Hui Zhen,

Refer to attachment for the supplementary

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LEIE T Spve the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 December, 2021 8:40 AM
To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: Final Bill : SLQ5374G

Hi Hui Zhen,

Case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LEXE T Spve the Larth Print only when necessary-

From: Siak Tong Sim [mailto:siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 13 December, 2021 2:37 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Final Bill : SLQ5374G

Dear Sir/Madam



Ok confirm lump sum $3.050.00/4 days
Thanks & Best Regards

S.T.Sim

Manager

Accident Reporting Center

No 4 JIn Besut

Singapore 619557

H/P: 65- 69559351

On Thu, Dec 9, 2021 at 9:51 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sim,

Refer to attachment for the revised supplementary
Finalised amount is $ 3,050 / 4 days of lump sum repair

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

LEXE T Spve the Larth Prnt only when necessary

From: Siak Tong Sim [mailto:siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 6 December, 2021 5:03 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: Final Bill : SLQ5374G



Dear Sir/Madam

Please refer attached final bill for SLQ5374G for your approval
Thanks & Best Regards

S.T.Sim

Manager

Accident Reporting Center

No 4 JIn Besut

Singapore 619557

H/P: 65- 69559351



