
 
 

YSK AUTO WORKSHOP 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 @Autobay, #01-71 Singapore 417883 
(UEN 53311047E) 
 
 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd    
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,  
Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
Tax Invoice : 202110-089 
Date  : 18/10/2021          
Vehicle No. : CB7742A          
Make Model  : TOYOTA HIACE 3.0 DX DIESEL TURBO AT 2WD, 2982C             
Accident Location/Date: 07/09/2021 15:50 (SGT), BUANGKOK DRIVE  
 
PARTICULAR          AMOUNT 
_________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Cost of Repairs & Labor          $.   950.00 

Loss of Use, 02 Days X @$200.00 per day       $.   400.00 

Pre-Repair Inspection, 02 Days x @$200.00 per day     $.   400.00 

Singapore Dollars: One Thousand Seven Hundred Fifty Only 

         Total S$: 1,750.00 

         ========================= 

 

 

__________________________ 

YSK Auto Workshop 



FBL7945R



YSK AUTO WORKSHOP UOB 045 3713051525



 
 

YSK AUTO WORKSHOP 
No. 1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 @Autobay, #01-71 Singapore 417883 
(UEN 53311047E) 
 
 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd    
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park,  
Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

REPAIR BILL 
 
Tax Invoice : 202110-089 
Date  : 18/10/2021          
Vehicle No. : CB7742A          
Make Model  : TOYOTA HIACE 3.0 DX DIESEL TURBO AT 2WD, 2982C             
Accident Location/Date: 07/09/2021 15:50 (SGT), BUANGKOK DRIVE  
 
PARTICULAR          AMOUNT 
_________________________________________________________________________________ 
 
Cost of Repair          $.   950.00 

 

Singapore Dollars: Nine Hundred Fifty Only 

         Total S$: 950.00 

         ========================= 

 

 

__________________________ 

YSK Auto Workshop 
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 8 June 2022 08:44
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB)
Subject: RE: [[MANDATE REQUEST] RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB // ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING FBL 7945R (CNB) AND CB 7742A (TP) ON 07/09/2021

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Asher 
 
Please proceed to make the offer. Thanks. 
 
Chris Tan 
Assistant Manager, Logistics Unit 
Corporate Services Division  
DID: (65) 6557 4315 
Mobile: (65) 9049 7706 
 

 

 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not 
copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized person is an 
offence under the Official Secrets Act 1935. Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 7 June 2022 4:40 pm 
To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: [[MANDATE REQUEST] RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB // ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBL 7945R 
(CNB) AND CB 7742A (TP) ON 07/09/2021 
 
Hi Chris, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Third party is chasing for settlement. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval / instruction if any. 
 
Thank You.  
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Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 11 March 2022 11:22 
To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: [[MANDATE REQUEST] RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB // ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBL 7945R (CNB) 
AND CB 7742A (TP) ON 07/09/2021 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBL 7945R (CNB) AND CB 7742A (TP) ON 07/09/2021 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
The accident occurred when CNB vehicle skidded and hit onto a civilian vehicle.  
 
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 100% liability. 
 
We seek your approval to offer repairer " YSK AUTO WORKSHOP" at $ 1,250.00 (all-in). 
 
The summary is as follows: - 
 

  Amount Claimed Amount Revised   
1. Cost of Repairs $   2,528.20 $     950.00   
2. Loss of Use (4days x $200) $      800.00 $     300.00 (3days x $100) 

Total $   3,328.20 $ 1,250.00   
 
Surveyor recommended 2days for repair. 
 
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval to offer to third party repairer. 
 
Thank You.  
 

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | did: 6841-6051 | Mobile: 8839 9816 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 12:41 
To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Hi Sir, 
 
Document well received, will process with our next action. 
 
Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me 
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 12:39 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Asher,  
Try this attachment. 
Otherwise I will request the unit to remove the security setting. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 12:25 pm 
To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Hi Sir, 
 
We refer to the email that have been sent, we are not able to open up the email. 
 
Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me 
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 11:44 AM 
To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Hi Sir, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly forward us the report the police report FBL 1365D if available. 
 
Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me 
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 22 October 2021 11:09 AM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: FW: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
Please see email from Ai Lee, ETHOZ . Understand from Ms Shirlene that you will follow-up with the issue on claim 
settlement. 
As for the FBL1365D reports. We will write it off as “beyond economics repairs” 
 
Regards 
 
Note: Ms Shirlene is taking higher appointment this November. You may want to delete her in your mailing address. 
 
 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 19 October 2021 3:00 pm 



5

To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) 
<Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 
Cc: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Hi Sir, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Third party have submitted the estimate and LOD for the mention matter. 
 
Kindly forward us the report from FBL 1365D if available 
. 
Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me 
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 14 September 2021 1:59 PM 
To: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) 
<Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 
Cc: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: RE: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Hi Sir, 
 
We acknowledge your assignment below. 
 
We will arrange to survey third party vehicle and necessary. 
 
Shall update the matter once third party submitted the estimate. 
 
Please be informed that we are currently deployed to work from home in view of the current COVID-19 situation may reach me 
at 8839 9816 for any urgent matters. 
 
Thank You.  
  

Best Regards, 
Asher Sng | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108| did: 6841-6051 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 

From: Mohamad Juahir ISMAIL (CNB) <Mohamad_Juahir_Ismail@cnb.gov.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 13 September 2021 12:23 PM 
To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 
Cc: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 
Subject: damaged claim by third party against CNB 
 
Hi Asher, 
 
We have another case for you to follow-up. This time MOP wants to claim for damage against his passenger van 
(CB7742A) 
 
Briefly, On 7 Sep 21, two of our motorcycles collided with one another at a traffic junction.  The collision caused one of 
our motorcycle (FBL1365D) to collide with CB7742A. 
The driver of CB7742A contacted me this morning indicating that he wants to claim damaged against CNB.  Please 
follow-up with the necessary and submit an interim update by 22 Sep. 
Grateful if you can also submit to us copies of their report and claim document. 
 
Attached photos of the damaged caused to CB7742A. The police report for FBL1365D is not available as the officer was 
seriously hurt  and requires immediate medical attention. 
We will send you the report once it is available. 
 
Below are the particular of the MOP and his insurance / workshop details. 
 

Accident Vehicle : CB7742A 
 
Detail Claimants Contact no 

 
MOP Mr Wong Kan Wye 97452828 

 
Insurer Sompo Insurance S’pore Pte Ltd 64616565 

 
Workshop Danny Yeo 

YSK auto workshop 
Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-71 
 

96402541 

 
Regards 
 
 
Mohamad Juahir Ismail 
Logistics Officer 
Corporate Service Division 
DID: (65) 63256596  Hp: 91501422 
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