Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 September 2021 3:17 PM

To: Evelyn Ng; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Fw: LOD FOR OUR VEH SLZ6733A LKK REF : CC4/AIG21009588/Kes3
Attachments: Authority to Act.pdf; Diver Contract.pdf; SLZ6733A SAS.pdf; SNA7733B SEARCH

receipt.pdf; AINV2109-009.pdf; SLZ6733A Cl.pdf

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

From: Evelyn Ng <evelyn1911ngsautomotive@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, September 29, 2021 3:01 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: LOD FOR OUR VEH SLZ6733A

Dear Sir/Madam

RE: ACCIDENT ON 10/09/2021 @22:20HRS

ALONG PAYA LEBARRD

INVOLVING VEHICLE NO SLZ6733A & SNA7733B

We understand that you are the insurer of SLZ6733A vehicle.

I/We wish to inform you that my/our vehicle SLZ6733A have been completed repairs to my/our
satisfaction by M/s NGS AUTOMOTIVE. I/'We therefore propose to claim from you as follow:-

1. Cost of Repair S$ 2650.00

2. LTA Search S$ 745

3. Loss Of Use— Sdays@$60.00 S$ 300.00 (Include
Sunday) )

TOTAL S$ 2957.45
1



A copy each of the following supporting documents 1s attached:-

a) Authorise to Act

b) Our bill M/s NGS Automotive
c¢) Cert of insurance

d) SLZ6733A SAS Report

e) SNA7733A LTA Search fee

f) Driver Contract

Please let us have your reply as soon as possible.

Thank you.

NGS AUTOMOTIVE

Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Pk 2A
#02-01 AMK AutPoint
Singapore 568047

Evelyn Ng HP 9695 5547



AUTHORISATION TO ACT
(Direct Third Party Claim)

I/We, __ Grace On Wheels Automobile Pte Ltd (“the third party claimant”), owner of SLZ6733A

(vehicle no.) hereby authorize NGS Automotive ( “the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my

claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim”) for my vehicle no. SLZ6733A
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 10/09/2021 (date) along Paya

Lebar Road (location) involving vehicle no./s SNA7733B (“the accident”).

[ further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop ¢ NGS Automotive .

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s concerned.

Dated this 12 (day) of ©9 (month) 20 2\ (year).

Signed" by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™(with chop)
(with chop if applicable)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, NGS _AUTOMOTIVE (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
S$$2.650.00 (Repair Cost), S$300.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), S$7.45 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SL.Z 6733A that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 10/09/2021 (date) along
PAYA LEBAR ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SNA 7733B. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 14/09/2021 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner GRACE ON WHEELS AUTOMOBILE
PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. SLZ 6733 A make the claim as set out in the
above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that
we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SLZ 6733 A (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this __09 (day) of ___11 (month) 20 21 (year)

© -

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by ‘Morkshop” (with chop)




NGS AUTONMOTIVE

Blk 10 Ang Mo Kio Ind. Pk 2a #02-01 AMK AutoPoint Singapore 568047

Tel: 64815727 Fax: 64815772 Email: evelyn1911ngsautomotive@gmail.com
Reg No.:53405718K

INVOICE
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD No. i AINV2109-009
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT Veh No . SLZ6733A HD SHUTTLE
78 SHENTON WAY Mileage
#07-16 AIG BUILDING Your Ref
SINGAPORE 079120 Our Ref
Date . 29/09/2021
TEL : 6419 3000 FAX : Page C1of1
Description Amount
S$
Accident on 10/09/2021 @22:20 hrs along Paya Lebar Rd
Involving SLZ6733A & SNA7733B
LUMP SUMP REPAIR 2,650.00
SURVEY BY LKK (MR KENNETH)
SINGAPORE DOLLAR TWO THOUSAND SIX HUNDRED FIFTY ONLY Net Totall 2,650.00)

Notes :
1. All cheques should be crossed and made payable to
NGS AUTOMOTIVE

2. Goods sold are neither returnable nor refundable.

v
Authlorised Signature



Land Transport Authority

Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 11 Sep 2021/ 18:55:04
Receipt Date/Time : 11 Sep 2021/ 18:54:56
Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-210911-002061
Previous Receipt No. :
S/N Item Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amount After GST
No. GST (S$) (S%$) (S%$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SNA7733B
As at 10 Sep 2021/22:20:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
1 Insurance Enquiry - SNA7733B
Enquiry Fee 7.00 0.49 7.49
20210911185357383288
Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49
Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49
Rounding Difference 0.04
Total Amount Payable 7.45
Paid By
426588XXXXXX1986 eNETS Credit Card 7.45
Total 7.45
Cash Change 0.00
Tendered Amount 7.45
Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.



Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 30 September 2021 11:14 AM

To: 'DERRICK@PACKAGINGHUB.SG'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNA 7733B AND SLZ 6733A ON 10/09/2021

Our Ref: CC4/A1G21009588/Kes3

30 SEPT 2021

KOH CHIN TIONG (XU JINZHONG)

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SNA 7733B AND SLZ 6733A ON 10/09/2021

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.
Yours faithfully,
Asher

Case Handler
Email: Ashersng@lkkauto.com

c.c.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)



11/9/21, 1:58 PM Merimen e-Claims

Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SLZ6733A (3898528347SG)
[SNA7733B]
TP
GRACE ON WHEELS AUTOMOBILE PTE LTD
Sep 10 2021 10:00PM
[KOH CHIN TIONG (XU JINZHONG)]
Ngs Automotive

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 02/11/2021 13:27 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$2957.45) - SLZ6733A - Claim Handler: Tan, Bennie-WZ

Approved:2957.45:SUBJ ALL DOCS/BILLING IN ORDER AND OI VEH PHOTOS VERIFIED, SAB FRM: $2897.45-
2957.45 (ALL-IN).

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_Print&CFID=89357139&CFTOKEN=343c9f77209a17d2-17...  1/1



